
IFB 6612 - Pricing Sheet for SUPPLY OF ELECTRIC METERS AND EQUIPMENT-REVISED

Exhibit 1
Respondent's Company Name:  Anixter Inc.  Techline, Inc. Texas Electric Cooperatives TEXAS METER AND DEVICE COMPANY, LLC  WESCO Distribution, Inc

City and State:  Corinth Tx  Fort Worth, TX Georgetown, TX  WACO, TX  Tulsa, OK

Item # EST. ANNL 
QTY

UOM Product Description Unit Price Extended Price
Estimated Delivery 

ARO (Days)
Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Delivery ARO 

(Days)
Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated 
Delivery ARO 

(Days)
Unit Price Extended Price

Estimated Delivery 
ARO (Days)

Unit Price Extended Price
Estimated 

Delivery ARO 
(Days)

1 20 EA Meter, Single Phase, Class 100, 120V, 2 wire, 1s 134.00$         2,680.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

2 12 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 100, 120V, 2 wire, 1s w/ Disconnect 
under the cover 139.00$         1,668.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

2 10 EA Meter, Single Phase, Class 100, 120V, 2 wire, 1s, w / kW Demand 142.00$         1,420.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

3 7,000 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 240V, 3 wire, 2s with Disconnect 
under the cover

131.00$         917,000.00$         8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

4 510 EA Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 240V, 3 wire, 2s, w/ kW Demand 320.00$         163,200.00$         8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

5 40 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 120-480V, 3 wire, 2s, w/ kW 
Demand

139.00$         5,560.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

6 20 EA Meter, Single Phase, Class 320, 240V, 3 wire, 2s 139.00$         2,780.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

7 40 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 320, 120-480V, 3 wire, 2s, w / kW 
Demand

139.00$         5,560.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

8 20 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 20, 120-480V, 3 wire, 4s, w / kW 
Demand

320.00$         6,400.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

9 30 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 120V, 3 wire, 12s /25s with 
Disconnect under the cover

320.00$         9,600.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

10 40 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 120-480V, 3 wire, 12s/25s, w/ 
kW Demand

320.00$         12,800.00$           8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

11 300 EA
Meter, Three Phase, Class 200, 120-480V, 4 wire, 15-16s, w/ kW 
Demand

320.00$         96,000.00$           8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

12 48 EA
Meter, Three Phase, Class 320, 120-480V, 4 wire, 15-16s, w/ kW 
Demand

320.00$         15,360.00$           8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

13 200 EA
Meter, Three Phase, Class 20, 120-480V, 4 wire, 8-9s, w/ kW 
Demand

320.00$         64,000.00$           8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

14 5 EA
Meter, Three Phase, Class 20, 120-480V, 4 wire, 8-9s, kWH, 
kW/kVA Demand  (4 quadrant kVA metering)

489.00$         2,445.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

15 Option: KYZ Pulse Initiator Board 61.00$           -$                      2-4 weeks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

 

16 5 EA
Meter, Three Phase, Class 20, 120-480V, 4 wire, 8-9s, kWH, 
kW/kVA Demand capable of alpha/numeric labeling of displays

428.00$         2,140.00$             8-10 wks No Quote No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

17 5 EA
Meter, Three Phase, Class 200, 120-480V, 4 wire, 15-16s, kWH, 
kW Demand capable of alpha/numeric labeling of displays

428.00$         2,140.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

18 5 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 120-480V, 3 wire, 2s, kWH, kW 
Demand capable of alpha/numeric labeling of displays

212.00$         1,060.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

19 50 EA
Meter, Single Phase, Class 200, 240V, 3 wire, 2s with Disconnect 
under the cover capable of alpha/numeric labeling of the 
displays

142.00$         7,100.00$             8-10 wks No Quote -$            No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

20 40 EA

Socket, Ring-less, 6 Terminal, 20 amp, One piece cover, Closure 
Plate, Seven Pole Test switch(Milbank #TS07-0105 or 
equivalent), Pre-wired with DME's color-coded wiring diagram 
for a 4S meter

175.00$         7,000.00$             4-6 wks 147.20$     5,888.00$       8-10 wks 172.00$      6,880.00$        35 176.32$               7,052.80$             40 DAYS 160.35$          6,414.00$           45

21 120 EA

Socket, Ring-less, 13 Terminal, 20 amp, One piece cover, Closure 
Plate, Ten Pole Test switch(Milbank #TS10-0109 or equivalent), 
Pre-wired with DME's color-coded wiring diagram for a 8-9S 
meter

195.00$         23,400.00$           4-6 wks 176.45$     21,174.00$     8-10 wks 195.00$      23,400.00$      35 205.00$               24,600.00$           40 DAYS 185.80$          22,296.00$         45

SECTION B- Photovolatic Meters

SECTION A- ELECTRIC METERS with Trilliant Secure Mesh 

SECTION C- ELECTRIC SOCKETS



Respondent's Company Name:  Anixter Inc.  Techline, Inc. Texas Electric Cooperatives TEXAS METER AND DEVICE COMPANY, LLC  WESCO Distribution, Inc

City and State:  Corinth Tx  Fort Worth, TX Georgetown, TX  WACO, TX  Tulsa, OK

Item # EST. ANNL 
QTY
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(Days)
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SECTION A  ELECTRIC METERS ith T illi t S  M h -$                      -$                    

22 300 EA

Current Transformers: 600 volt, over-bushing type 500:5, ANSI 
meter accuracy class .3B-0.1, rating factor of 4.0 @ 30 C. 
Extended range (4%-40% at .6 accuracy as defined by IEEE 
C57.13)

68.00$           20,400.00$           4-6 wks 97.11$       29,133.00$     8-10 wks 67.00$        20,100.00$      35 70.26$                 21,078.00$           7 DAYS 123.35$          37,005.00$         30

23 30 EA

Current Transformers: 600 volt, over-bushing type 1000:5, ANSI 
meter accuracy class .3B-0.9, rating factor of 2.0 @ 30 C. 
Extended range (4%-40% at .6 accuracy as defined by IEEE 
C57.13)

68.00$           2,040.00$             4-6 wks 90.71$       2,721.30$       8-10 wks 67.00$        2,010.00$        35 72.79$                 2,183.70$             7 DAYS 129.40$          3,882.00$           30

24 6 EA
Current Transformers: 600 volt, over-bushing type 2000:5, ANSI 
meter accuracy class .3B-1.8, rating factor of 2.0 @ 30 C. 
Extended range (4%-40% at .6 accuracy as difined by C57.13)

68.00$           408.00$                4-6 wks 112.55$     675.30$          8-10 wks 67.00$        402.00$            35 78.86$                 473.16$                7 DAYS 142.85$          857.10$              30

25 36 EA
Current Transformers: 100:5 ratio, 600 volt, window type. 2.5" 
window, ANSI meter accuracy class .3B-0.5, rating factor of 4.0 
@ 30 C. 

73.00$           2,628.00$             4-6 wks 257.86$     9,282.96$       8-10 wks 74.50$        2,682.00$        35 69.25$                 2,493.00$             7 DAYS 93.70$            3,373.20$           30

26 60 EA

Current Transformers: 500:5 ratio, 600 volt, window type. 2.5" 
window, ANSI meter accuracy class .3B-0.5, rating factor of 4.0 
@ 30 C. Extended range (4%-40% at .6 accuracy as difined by 
IEEE C57.13)

68.00$           4,080.00$             4-6 wks 92.37$       5,542.20$       8-10 wks 67.00$        4,020.00$        35 73.30$                 4,398.00$             7 DAYS 93.70$            5,622.00$           30

-$                    

27 6 EA

Voltage Transformers: ANSI accuracy class 0.3 thru Burden Z, 
Thermal Rating 1500 VA at 30 degrees C ambient, 8400:120 
voltage rating, single bushing, 110 KV BIL, ABB Type VOZ-11M, 
Part #7525A91G07 or equal

770.00$         4,620.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 745.00$      4,470.00$        49 1,162.00$            6,972.00$             35 DAYS 1,014.50$      6,087.00$           30

28 6 EA
Current Transformers: ANSI accuracy class .3 thru B-0.5, 110 KV, 
BIL, 13,800 nominal or 15 KV acceptable

600.00$         3,600.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      3,420.00$        49 644.30$               3,865.80$             35 DAYS -$                -$                    30

29 3 EA 15:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G02 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 644.30$               1,932.90$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

30 3 EA 20:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G03 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 644.30$               1,932.90$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

31 3 EA 25:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G04 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 644.30$               1,932.90$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

32 3 EA 30:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G05 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 644.30$               1,932.90$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

33 3 EA 40:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G06 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 653.81$               1,961.43$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

34 3 EA 50:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G07 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 660.60$               1,981.80$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

35 3 EA 100:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G09 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 660.60$               1,981.80$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

36 3 EA 200:5 ABB Type KON-11, Part #7524A25G11 or equal 600.00$         1,800.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 570.00$      1,710.00$        49 660.60$               1,981.80$             35 DAYS 764.75$          2,294.25$           30

37 3 EA
200:5 ratio Primary Current Transformer Accuracy class 0.15% 
extended range, RF 1.5 @ 30c, 13,800v or 15kV acceptable

865.00$         2,595.00$             6-8 wks No Quote 817.00$      2,451.00$        49 839.23$               2,517.69$             35 DAYS 904.70$          2,714.10$           30

38 1 EA Trilliant Secure Mesh PSU Card 552.00$       552.00$                8-10 wks No Quote  No Bid -$                    -$                      NO BID -$               -$                    

39 1 EA Trilliant Secure Mesh PSU 2,579.00$    2,579.00$             8-10 wks No Quote  No Bid -$                    -$                      NO BID -$               -$                    

40 1 EA Trilliant Secure Mesh Extender Bridge 9,189.00$     9,189.00$             8-10 wks No Quote  No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

41 1 EA Trilliant Secure Mesh Repeaters 552.00$         552.00$                8-10 wks No Quote  No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

42 1 EA Trilliant Secure Mesh Gateway 17,668.00$   17,668.00$           8-10 wks No Quote  No Bid -$                     -$                      NO BID -$                -$                    

1,434,624.00$    74,416.76$   83,515.00$    91,272.58$         106,604.40$    
 

SECTION F- TRILLIANT SECURE MESH AMI EQUIPMENT

Total Cost of Products (Annual)

SECTION D- SECONDARY INSTRUMENT RATED 

SECTION E- PRIMARY INSTRUMENT RATED TRANSFORMERS
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