
RFP # 6412  EVALUATION SHEET TECHLINE, INC.

Pricing Sheet for Electric Transmission Line Conductor Attachments/ Pole Hardware 
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SECTION A- HUBBELL BRAND PRODUCTS

1 45 EA 32010053
JUMPER CLAMP, POST INSULATOR, AL, DBL 1.0-1.4"D, FOR 2-HOLE 

BLADE, 18" SPACING
93.00$         4,185.00$         6

10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0
164.73$       7,412.85$         8

7.5 20.0 10.0 33.9 71.4

2 5 EA 32010055
JUMPER CLAMP, POST INSULATOR, AL, SGL 1.0-1.4"D, FOR 2-HOLE 

BLADE
48.70$         243.50$            6

5.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 95.0
84.18$         420.90$            3

10.0 20.0 10.0 34.7 74.7

3 5 EA 32010056
CLAMP-CABLE TO INSULATOR SUPPORT, 0.522"-1.632" DIA, 11/16" 

HOLES ON 5" BC W\ MOUNTING HARDWARE
52.10$         260.50$            2

10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0
56.40$         282.00$            4

5.0 20.0 10.0 55.4 90.4

4 5 EA 32010061
DAMPER-STOCKBRIDGE VIBRATION, 959.6 ACSS/TW/HS BARE, .859-

1.130"D CLAMP
32.50$         162.50$            8

3.8 20.0 5.0 60.0 88.8
33.25$         166.25$            3

10.0 20.0 10.0 58.6 98.6

5 1,000 EA 32010052 ANCHOR SHACKLE 7/8"WD, 3/4" PIN, 60K, GALV BNC 10.90$         10,900.00$       2
10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

11.20$         11,200.00$       8
2.5 20.0 10.0 58.4 90.9

6 1,000 EA 32010051 ANCHOR SHACKLE 7/8"WD, 5/8" PIN, 30K, GALV BNC 6.80$           6,800.00$         2
10.0 20.0 10.0 36.6 76.6

4.15$           4,150.00$         4
5.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 95.0

7 5 EA 32010066
CLEVIS-EYE, 7/8" WIDE CLEVIS, 1-3/4" WIDE EYE, 5/8"D PIN, 11/16"D 

HOLE, BNC
25.90$         129.50$            7

Did not meet specifications
26.24$         131.20$            10

10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

8 5 EA 32010068 CLEVIS-SOCKET 7/8" WIDE 5/8"D PIN 30K BNC 12.00$         60.00$              10 Did not meet specifications 15.42$         77.10$              4 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

9 200 EA 32010071 LINK-CHAIN EYE 3/4" 60K 1"X3-1/2" OPENING 7.10$           1,420.00$         2 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0 9.30$           1,860.00$         8 2.5 20.0 10.0 45.8 78.3

10 5 EA 32010072 SOCKET-EYE 1" WIDE EYE, 11/16"D HOLE 30K 5.60$           28.00$              10 Did not meet specifications 11.20$         56.00$              2 10.0 20.0 10.0 30.0 70.0

11 80 EA 32010073 SOCKET-EYE 1" WIDE EYE, 13/16"D HOLE 30K 7.30$           584.00$            10 Did not meet specifications 10.03$         802.40$            3 10.0 20.0 10.0 43.7 83.7

12 70 EA 32010074 SOCKET-EYE 1-3/4" WIDE EYE, 11/16" HOLE 30K 7.90$           553.00$            7 8.6 20.0 10.0 60.0 98.6 12.00$         840.00$            6 10.0 20.0 10.0 39.5 79.5

13 70 EA 32010075 Y-CLEVIS BALL HOT LINE, 9-5/16" LONG, 3/4"D PIN, 30K 15.60$         1,092.00$         8 3.8 15.0 10.0 60.0 88.8 18.90$         1,323.00$         3 10.0 20.0 10.0 49.5 89.5

14 400 EA 32010076 Y-CLEVIS BALL, 3/4"D PIN, 30K 7.00$           2,800.00$         2 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0 9.17$           3,668.00$         2 10.0 20.0 10.0 45.8 85.8

15 400 EA 32010078 Y-CLEVIS EYE, 90 DEG, 1" WIDE EYE, 3/4" BOLT, 30K GALV 13.60$         5,440.00$         7 5.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 95.7 16.56$         6,624.00$         4 10.0 20.0 10.0 49.3 89.3

16 500 EA 28772240 Y-CLEVIS SOCKET, 3/4"D PIN, 30K 15.00$         7,500.00$         2 10.0 20.0 10.0 50.4 90.4 12.59$         6,295.00$         8 2.5 15.0 10.0 60.0 87.5

17 300 EA 28579620 YOKE PLATE, 3-POINT, 3/4" THK, 18"X5", (1)1-1/8" & (2) 1-1/4" HOLES, 60K 78.05$         23,415.00$       7
8.6 10.0 10.0 55.1 83.7

71.65$         21,495.00$       6
10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

18 300 EA 32010082
YOKE PLATE, 4-POINT, 5/8" THK, 18"X6", (2) 11/16" & (2) 15/16" HOLES, 

30K
89.00$         26,700.00$       7

10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0
104.90$       31,470.00$       10

7.0 20.0 10.0 50.9 87.9

19 5 EA 32010085 SUSPENSION CLAMP, AL 0.70-1.18" 25K W/SOCKET EYE (SA-10) BNC 24.80$         124.00$            7
10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

45.23$         226.15$            10
7.0 20.0 10.0 32.9 69.9

20 10 EA 32010069 CLEVIS SOCKET 32.30$         323.00$            10 Did not meet specifications 31.00$         310.00$            4 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

21 15 EA 32010077 Y CLEVIS 90 DEGREE 27.90$         418.50$            10 2.0 10.0 10.0 60.0 82.0 36.05$         540.75$            4 10.0 20.0 10.0 46.4 86.4

22 10 EA 32010083 YOKE PLATE CRESCENT 43.70$         437.00$            10 8.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 98.0 235.70$       2,357.00$         8 10.0 20.0 10.0 11.1 51.1

23 5 EA 32010062 SUSPENSION CLAMP 14.60$         73.00$              8 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0 36.50$         182.50$            8 10.0 20.0 10.0 24.0 64.0

SECTION B- PREFORMED BRAND PRODUCTS

24 150 EA 32010065 DAMPER-SPIRAL VIBRATION, .564-.760"D, 66" LONG (OPGW) 11.10$         1,665.00$         4 10.0 18.0 10.0 56.2 94.2 10.40$         1,560.00$         6 6.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 96.7

25 5 EA 32010096 ARMOR-GRIP SUSPENSION, 0.769" - 0.795" DIA, CAIRO, AAAC 53.10$         265.50$            4 10.0 18.0 10.0 56.9 94.9 50.35$         251.75$            6 6.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 96.7

26 30 EA 32010057
ARMOR-GRIP SUSPENSION, 1.091"-1.118" DIA, 82" LG RODS, 200C 

RATING
77.70$         2,331.00$         4

10.0 18.0 10.0 56.9 94.9
73.70$         2,211.00$         6

6.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 96.7

27 5 EA 32010058 ARMOR-GRIP SUSPENSION 152.80$       764.00$            4
10.0 18.0 10.0 56.2 94.2

143.00$       715.00$            6
6.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 96.7

28 400 EA 32010059
SPACER-CUSHION GRIP, 2-BUNDLE 18" SPACING, 1.107"-1.146"D, 200C 

RATING
40.40$         16,160.00$       4

10.0 18.0 10.0 56.3 94.3
37.92$         15,168.00$       6

6.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 96.7

29 50 EA 32010064 DAMPER-SPIRAL VIBRATION, .327-.461"D, 51" LONG (EHS) 3.86$           193.00$            4
10.0 18.0 10.0 56.7 94.7

3.65$           182.50$            6
6.7 20.0 10.0 60.0 96.7

30 10 EA 32010067 CLEVIS EYE 14.90$         149.00$            10 6.0 20.0 10.0 36.4 72.4 9.05$           90.50$              6 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

31 10 EA 32010079 YOKE PLATE 3 PT 26" SPACING 142.40$       1,424.00$         7 8.6 20.0 10.0 60.0 98.6 163.00$       1,630.00$         6 10.0 20.0 10.0 52.4 92.4

32 5 EA 32010063 ARMOR ROD 3.60$           18.00$              4 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0 4.53$           22.65$              6 6.7 20.0 10.0 47.7 84.3

33 5 EA 32010095 Y-CLEVIS EYE, 0.751-1.005", 11/16" HOLE, 20K 17.80$         89.00$              10 6.0 20.0 10.0 51.7 87.7 15.35$         76.75$              6 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

SECTION C- MISC BRAND PRODUCTS

34 5 EA 32010081
YOKE PLATE, 3-POINT, 5/8" THK, 18"X6-1/4", (1) 1" & (2) 13/16" HOLES, 

40K
74.30$         371.50$            7

10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0
160.00$       800.00$            10

7.0 20.0 10.0 27.9 64.9

35 5 EA 32010084
BANDING ADAPTER-POST INSULATOR, 5-1/2"X14", (2) 5/8"X6"LG BOLTS 

W/ NUT, 12" SPACING, FOR 1-1/4" BANDING
66.00$         330.00$            4

5.4 20.0 10.0 60.0 95.4
85.00$         425.00$            4

5.4 20.0 10.0 46.6 81.9

36 20 EA 32010054
JUMPER CLAMP, POST INSULATOR, AL, DBL 1.108-1.196"D W/ 5" BC, 18" 

SPACING
110.00$       2,200.00$         6

8.3 20.0 10.0 48.9 87.2
89.68$         1,793.60$         5

10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

37 5 EA 32010086 WEIGHT-50LBS, 1.108" DIA 795 DRAKE OR EQUIV, 138KV 142.40$       712.00$            8 Did not meet specifications 470.00$       2,350.00$         4 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

38 10 EA 32010091 ANCHOR PLATE FOR 3/4" ANCHOR ROD, GALVANIZED 26.50$         265.00$            2 10.0 20.0 10.0 51.2 91.2 22.60$         226.00$            4 5.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 95.0

39 5 EA 32010094 ROD, ANCHOR, TWIN EYE, 3/4" X 8"-0" 15.60$         78.00$              2 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0 15.80$         79.00$              6 10.0 20.0 10.0 59.2 99.2

40 50 EA 32020770 THIMBLE, CLEVIS 13.10$         655.00$            6 3.3 20.0 10.0 46.0 79.4 10.05$         502.50$            2 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

ADDITIONAL ITEM FOR BEST AND FINAL OFFER (BAFO):

41 100 EA GROUND CLAMP No Bid 9.95$           995.00$            6 10.0 20.0 10.0 60.0 100.0

EVALUATION EVALUATION

IRBY UTILITIES TECHLINE, INC.

Ft. Worth, TX

IRBY UTILITIES

Fort Worth, TX



APFELBAUM INDUSTRIAL, INC

EL PASO, TX

Item # Unit Price
Extended 

Price

Estimated 

Delivery ARO
Delivery

Compliance 

with Specs

Probable 

Performance
Price

Total Evaluated 

Score

SECTION A- HUBBELL BRAND PRODUCTS

1 663.25$       29,846.25$       8
8 20 7 8 42.9

2 219.28$       1,096.40$         8
4 20 7 13 44.1

3 324.83$       1,624.15$         8
3 20 7 10 39.1

4 77.68$         388.40$            8
4 20 7 25 55.9

5 20.94$         20,940.00$       8
3 20 7 31 60.7

6 9.93$           9,930.00$         8
3 20 7 25 54.6

7 39.29$         196.45$            8
9 20 7 40.1 75.8

8 43.11$         215.55$            8 5 20 7 21.5 53.5

9 13.11$         2,622.00$         8 3 20 7 32 62.0

10 22.90$         114.50$            8 3 20 7 29.3 58.8

11 22.90$         1,832.00$         8 4 20 7 26.3 57.0

12 22.90$         1,603.00$         8 8 20 7 21 55.2

13 26.28$         1,839.60$         8 4 20 7 36 66.4

14 13.00$         5,200.00$         8 3 20 7 32 61.8

15 41.74$         16,696.00$       8 5 20 7 20 51.5

16 34.29$         17,145.00$       8 3 20 7 22 51.5

17 105.92$       31,776.00$       8
8 20 7 44 78.7

18 233.18$       69,954.00$       8
9 20 7 23 58.7

19 90.41$         452.05$            8
9 20 7 16 52.2

20 72.83$         728.30$            8 5 20 7 26 57.5

21 70.43$         1,056.45$         8 5 20 7 30.7 62.7

22 483.53$       4,835.30$         8 10 20 7 5 42.4

23 73.00$         365.00$            8 10 20 7 12 49.0

SECTION B- PREFORMED BRAND PRODUCTS

24 34.85$         5,227.50$         7 6 20 7 18 50.6

25 107.73$       538.65$            7 6 20 7 28 60.8

26 167.78$       5,033.40$         7
6 20 7 26 59.1

27 282.94$       1,414.70$         7
6 20 7 30 63.0

28 95.00$         38,000.00$       7
6 20 7 24 56.7

29 13.14$         657.00$            7
6 20 7 17 49.4

30 16.33$         163.30$            7 9 20 7 33 68.8

31 295.14$       2,951.40$         7 9 20 7 29 64.5

32 22.84$         114.20$            7 6 20 7 9 42.2

33 27.64$         138.20$            7 9 20 7 33 68.9

SECTION C- MISC BRAND PRODUCTS

34 No Bid

35 118.83$       594.15$            2
10 20 7 33 70.3

36 No Bid

37 No Bid

38 48.74$         487.40$            2 10 20 7 28 64.8

39 39.39$         196.95$            2 10 20 7 24.1 61.1

40 33.75$         1,687.50$         2 10 20 7 18 54.9

ADDITIONAL ITEM FOR BEST AND FINAL OFFER (BAFO):

41 No Bid

APFELBAUM INDUSTRIAL, INC

EVALUATION


