

**Exhibit 2**

**RFP 8316 - Pricing Evaluation for Utility Bodies**

Respondent's Business Name: **Allout Custom Truck and Body #1** Platinum Ford North LLC  
 Principal Place of Business (City and State): **North Richland Hills, TX** Pilot Point, TX

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Unit
<b>1</b>	<b>Section A - Utility Bodies</b>				
2	Knapheide 696J	1	EA	\$14,838.25	\$12,696.00
3	Knapheide 696FJ40	1	EA	\$16,668.25	\$13,906.00
4	Knapheide 6108D54	1	EA	\$15,863.25	\$14,690.00
5	Knapheide 6108D54J40	1	EA	\$17,373.25	\$13,706.00
6	Knapheide 6132D54FJ40	1	EA	\$22,253.25	\$19,796.00
7	Knapheide 6132D54LPJ	1	EA	\$16,143.25	\$17,881.00
8	Knapheide 6132D54J1-CRK	1	EA	\$27,164.25	\$24,647.00
9	Knapheide PGNB-96A	1	EA	\$7,175.75	\$8,149.00
10	Knapheide PGNB-116A	1	EA	\$7,255.75	\$8,575.00
11	Tommy Gate 89-25 TP-42 2500#	1	EA	\$10,339.00	\$10,954.83
12	Tommy gate G2-92-1650 LD34	1	EA	\$4,685.00	\$6,472.00
13	Rugby TS-12-6SW/SF2355	1	EA	\$24,321.25	\$27,452.00
14	Animal Control Unit Deerskin ACCM4	1	EA	\$0.00	No Bid
15	Animal Control Unit Deerskin ACCM4-43	1	EA	\$0.00	No Bid
16	SWAB Animal Transport Bodies	1	EA	\$0.00	No Bid
17	Percent off list price for any non-listed utility bodies	1	EA	2.0%	No Bid
18	Installation	1	Hourly Rate	\$148.00	\$185.00
<b>Total:</b>				<b>\$184,228.50</b>	<b>\$179,109.83</b>

<b>Evaluation</b>			
Item #	Standard Criteria	Allout Custom Truck and Body #1	Platinum Ford North LLC
1	Delivery/Project Schedule - 20%	16.00	9.33
2	Compliance with Specifications - 30%	24.00	16.00
3	Probable Performance - 20%	16.00	8.00
4	Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 30%	29.16	30.00
<b>Total Score:</b>		<b>85.16</b>	<b>63.33</b>