Exhibit 2
8497 - Pricing Comparison for Office Supplies

Vendor Name: AmazolerS érvu:es, Staples Advantage c ORSCl)JIIQLAITI'I ON Summus Industries | Plano Office Supply | iOffice (iCopy LLC) Prefs;zticczsfflce CamOUf:szd Sisters D?j;ﬁeasn(c;s;:ce O[;F; EEZ::SS
Line # Description QTY|UOM| Unit Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended
1 [Appointment Books - 8"x12" Monthly planner 60 EA $14.49 $869.40| $10.02 $601.20| $7.78 $466.80| $7.68 $460.80| $8.59 $515.40| $14.54 $872.40| $11.11 $666.60| $9.94 $596.40| $26.17| $1,570.20| $21.19| $1,271.40
2 Batteries AA - Duracell 40 EA $11.70 $468.00| $14.98 $599.20| $14.74 $589.60| $18.73 $749.20| $32.82| $1,312.80| $32.82| $1,312.80| $10.19 $407.60| $24.99 $999.60| $31.99| $1,279.60| $25.84| $1,033.60
3 Batteries AAA - Duracell 32 EA $10.09 $322.79| $16.16 $517.12| $14.45 $462.40| $19.69 $630.08| $19.62 $627.84| $32.48| $1,039.36| $40.49| $1,295.68| $12.99 $415.68| $33.16| $1,061.12| $28.67 $917.44
4 Binder Clips - medium 15 EA $15.84 $237.53| $10.45 $156.75| $6.16 $92.40| $7.84 $117.60| $1.96 $29.40| $3.36 $50.40| $2.35 $35.25| $8.99 $134.85| $25.36 $380.40| $0.67 $10.05
5 Binders - Staples 1" 3-Ring View 15 EA $5.85 $87.70| $3.28 $49.20| $2.12 $31.80| $2.05 $30.75| $2.01 $30.15| $2.88 $43.20| $2.08 $31.20| $8.99 $134.85| $2.14 $32.10| $1.89 $28.35
6 Binders - Avery Heavy Duty 2" 3-Ring View 20 EA $5.08 $101.60] $6.68 $133.60| $6.75 $135.00| $6.83 $136.60| $8.16 $163.20| $9.67 $193.40| $11.05 $221.00| $8.99 $179.80| $10.00 $200.00| $7.99 $159.80
7 Binders - Avery Heavy Duty 3" 3-Ring View 19 EA $11.34 $215.46] $6.88 $130.72| $7.61 $144.59| $8.00 $152.00| $12.88 $244.72| $13.67 $259.73| $14.72 $279.68| $8.99 $170.81| $32.13 $610.47| $10.99 $208.81
8 Bottled Creamer - Coffeemate French Vanilla 24 EA $13.51 $324.12| $19.92 $478.08) $17.31 $415.44|$22.19 $532.56| $21.55 $517.20| $22.49 $539.76| $25.85 $620.40| $27.99 $671.76| $22.86 $548.64| $24.22 $581.28
9 Bottled Water - Nestle Pure Life 8 0z 31 EA $11.44 $354.64| $10.10 $313.10| $4.99 $154.69) $10.37 $321.47) $7.13 $221.03] $11.11 $344.41| $7.22 $223.82| $21.99 $681.69| $15.54 $481.74| $14.39 $446.09
10 |Bottled Water - True Clear 18 EA $9.50 $171.00] $10.10 $181.80| $3.64 $65.52| $8.96 $161.28| $7.13 $128.34| $10.44 $187.92| $7.22 $129.96| $25.99 $467.82| $12.97 $233.46| $12.59 $226.62
11 |House of Doolittle 22" x 17" Monthly Desk Pad Calendar 56 EA $8.94 $500.64| $7.88 $441.28| $6.41 $358.96| $13.27 $743.12) $7.13 $399.28| $11.93 $668.08| $8.88 $497.28| $15.49 $867.44| $15.95 $893.20| $5.59 $313.04
12 |Clasp Envelopes - 9 x 12 19 EA $17.15 $325.85| $11.99 $227.81] $19.00 $361.00| $10.53 $200.07] $10.71 $203.49| $18.49 $351.31| $13.31 $252.89| $21.00 $399.00| $13.91 $264.29| $9.04 $171.76
13 |Clasp Envelopes - 6 x 9 14 EA $27.71 $387.94| $9.14 $127.96| $8.14 $113.96)| $16.53 $231.42| $10.25 $143.50| $33.77 $472.78| $39.72 $556.08| $21.00 $294.00| $13.61 $258.59| $6.56 $91.84
14 |Dixie PerfecTouch Paper Hot Cups, 16 0z 61 EA $5.30 $323.24] $3.99 $243.39| $8.72 $531.92| $7.11 $433.71) $8.59 $523.99| $12.40 $756.40| $9.72 $592.92) $20.00| $1,220.00| $10.48 $639.28| $7.99 $487.39
15 [Coffee Cups - Perk™ Compostable Paper Hot Cup, 16 Oz. 44 EA $32.02 $1,408.70| $31.54| $1,387.76/$28.45| $1,251.80|$32.87| $1,446.28| $47.77| $2,101.88| $45.60| $2,006.40 $7.57 $333.08) $35.00| $1,540.00| $52.83| $2,324.52| $59.83| $2,632.52
16 [Coffee Cups - Perk™ Paper Hot Cup, 12 Oz 36 EA $1,799.82| $39.69| $1,428.84|$33.11| $1,191.96|$36.45| $1,312.20 $6.60 $237.60| $7.13 $256.68| $60.10| $2,163.60| $8.99 $323.64| $67.97| $2,446.92| $86.52| $3,114.72
17 [Coffee Cups - Perk™ Compostable Paper Hot Cup, 12 Oz 9 EA $41.37 $372.33] $38.93 $350.37] $35.71 $321.39| $41.49 $373.41) $5.05 $45.45| $9.53 $85.77| $60.10 $540.90| $8.99 $80.91| $67.97 $611.73| $59.81 $538.29
18 | Coffee Stirrers - Eco-Products Brown Wood Stirrers, 1000/Pack 17 EA $10.25 $174.25| $7.24 $123.08| $7.86 $133.62| $8.50 $144.50| $7.36 $125.12) $12.41 $210.97| $8.62 $146.54| $8.99 $152.83| $3.31 $56.27| $9.06 $154.02
19 [Cold Cups - Perk™ Compostable Plastic Cold Cup, 16 Oz 41 EA $21.45 $879.45| $44.44| $1,822.04|$42.19| $1,729.79|$40.13| $1,645.33| $40.79| $1672.39| $55.70| $2,283.70| $3.01 $123.41) $8.99 $368.59| $96.40| $3,952.40($228.99| $9,388.59
20 __|Scotch Indoor Mounting Squares, 1" x 1" 59 EA $2.91 $171.59| $3.16 $186.44)$14.75| $2,839.08| $1.32 $77.88| $1.46 $86.14| $1.88 $110.92) $1.60 $94.40| $6.85 $404.15| $1.53 $90.27| $2.69 $158.71
21 |Staples Correction Tape, White, 10/Pack 38 EA $5.37 $204.13| $8.36 $317.68| $8.89 $337.82| $5.29 $201.02| $11.16 $424.08)| $6.67 $253.46| $8.56 $325.28| $16.39 $622.82| $18.28 $694.64| $12.89 $489.82
22 |Creamer cups - Coffeemate French Vanilla 100 [EA $27.98 $2,798.00| $39.27| $3,927.00|$35.51| $3,551.00|$43.67| $4,367.00| $65.10| $6,510.00| $46.38| $4,638.00| $25.07| $2,507.00| $32.00| $3,200.00| $24.14| $2,414.00| $68.99| $6,899.00
23 |Creamer cups - Coffeemate Hazlenut 57 EA  ]$19.29 $1,099.53| $19.31| $1,100.67|$18.81| $1,072.17|$24.12| $1,374.84| $20.76| $1,183.32| $22.42| $1,277.94| $25.06| $1,428.42| $32.00| $1,824.00| $24.14| $1,375.98| $24.12| $1,374.84
24 | Creamer cups - Coffeemate Original 85 EA  |$23.98 $2,038.30| $31.92| $2,713.20/$29.18| $2,480.30|$38.80| $3,298.00| $46.46| $3,949.10| $38.42| $3,265.70| $46.89| $3,985.65| $32.00| $2,720.00| $37.56| $3,192.60| $56.91| $4,837.35
25 |Creamer Cups - Minimoos half and half 24 EA  |$11.98 $287.52| $17.19 $412.56| $15.24 $365.76)| $18.75 $450.00| $41.40 $993.60| $22.18 $532.32| $23.41 $561.84| $25.00 $600.00| $27.80 $667.20| $22.39 $537.36
26 |Purell Automatic Wall Mounted Soap Dispensers 53 EA $7.49 $396.97| $19.04| $1,009.12($18.54 $982.62| $16.00 $848.00) $1.76 $93.28| $5.00 $265.00) $30.10| $1,595.30| $13.45 $712.85| $8.24 $436.72| $26.20| $1,388.60
27 _|Lysol Disinfectant Spray, Crisp Linen Scent, 19 oz. 21 EA $5.51 $115.73| $8.51 $178.71| $7.27 $152.67| $9.99 $209.79| $9.58 $201.18| $9.65 $202.65| $9.95 $208.95)| $10.69 $224.49| $9.88 $207.48| $8.20 $172.20
28 | Disinfectant Wipes - Clorox 83 EA $8.52 $707.45] $12.29| $1,020.07|$12.07| $1,001.81|$12.29| $1,020.07| $15.14| $1,256.62| $14.99| $1,244.17| $17.97| $1,491.51| $10.69 $887.27| $17.23| $1,430.09| $9.12 $756.96
29 |TRU RED Durable Dry Erase Eraser, Black 16 EA $1.25 $19.96] $1.89 $30.24| $1.49 $23.84| $1.24 $19.84| $1.45 $23.20| $2.40 $38.40| $1.62 $25.92| $5.00 $80.00| $1.82 $29.12| $1.35 $21.60
30 |Envelopes - Size 10 30 EA  |$25.55 $766.50| $11.56 $346.80| $9.52 $285.60| $14.24 $427.20| $6.90 $207.00| $11.09 $332.70| $7.81 $234.30) $38.00| $1,140.00| $12.47 $374.10| $19.66 $589.80
31 |Gatorade - Fruit Punch 72 EA  |$50.77 $3,655.44| $38.89| $2,800.08|$32.55| $2,343.60|$38.10| $2,743.20| $28.90| $2,080.80| $35.67| $2,568.24| $32.26| $2,322.72| $38.00| $2,736.00| $40.07| $2,885.04| $46.49| $3,347.28
32 | Ground Coffee - Dunkin Donuts 10 EA  |$15.99 $159.90| $17.86 $178.60| $15.69 $156.90| $23.57 $235.70| $37.94 $379.40| $23.99 $239.90| $17.80 $178.00) $9.99 $99.90| $22.87 $228.70| $30.99 $309.90
33 |Ground Coffee - Folgers 119 [EA  |$11.00 $1,308.80| $9.67| $1,150.73/$10.04| $1,194.76| $9.67| $1,150.73| $16.05| $1,909.95| $12.97| $1,543.43| $17.80| $2,118.20| $9.99| $1,188.81| $13.38| $1,592.22| $13.31| $1,583.89
34 | Ground Coffee - Starbucks 7 EA  |$18.89 $132.23| $15.87 $111.09) $16.77 $117.39) $16.60 $116.20| $28.34 $198.38| $19.53 $136.71) $22.11 $154.77) $9.99 $69.93| $24.40 $170.80| $29.99 $209.93
35 |PURE 12 ozLL Advanced Gel Hand Sanitizer 189 |EA $4.38 $827.35| $4.71 $890.19| $4.56 $861.84| $5.04 $952.56) $5.11 $965.79|  $5.00 $945.00) $5.71| $1,079.19) $49.99| $9,448.11| $5.76| $1,088.64| $5.26 $994.14
36 | Dial Basics Liquid Hand Soap 7.5 oz 28 EA $1.24 $34.72| $2.28 $63.84| $2.67 $74.76| $3.36 $94.08| $1.95 $54.60| $2.85 $79.80| $2.00 $56.00| $4.00 $112.00] $3.10 $86.80 $3.27 $91.56
37 |Logitech H390 Computer Headset, Over-the-Head 17 EA  |$19.97 $339.49| $14.99 $254.83) $16.09 $273.53| $19.79 $336.43| $27.25 $463.25| $24.49 $416.33| $28.01 $476.17| $25.00 $425.00| $25.75 $437.75| $20.74 $352.58
38 |Sharpie Tank Highlighter, Chisel Tip, Assorted, Dozen 21 EA $6.62 $139.02| $5.54 $116.34| $8.08 $169.68| $6.48 $136.08)| $7.46 $156.66) $9.09 $190.89| $9.52 $199.92) $12.29 $258.09| $10.80 $226.80| $6.49 $136.29
39 [Kcups Coffee - Dunkin Donuts 29 EA  ]$39.99 $1,159.71| $55.96| $1,622.84|$53.99| $1,565.71|$61.76] $1,791.04| $76.38| $2,215.02| $65.99| $1,913.71| $23.23 $673.67| $22.00 $638.00| $66.94| $1,941.26| $68.23| $1,978.67
40 |Kcups Coffee - Green Mountain 123 [EA  |$11.23 $1,380.98| $14.17| $1,742.91|$14.39| $1,769.97|$15.47| $1,902.81| $17.12| $2,105.76| $18.49| $2,274.27| $21.51| $2,645.73| $22.00| $2,706.00| $13.40| $1,648.20| $16.82| $2,068.86
41 |Kcups Coffee - Starbucks 104 [EA  |$11.33 $1,178.06] $20.37| $2,118.48|$19.79| $2,058.16|$24.29| $2,526.16| $23.30| $2,423.20| $23.17| $2,409.68| $24.77| $2,576.08| $22.00| $2,288.00| $24.71| $2,569.84| $21.55| $2,241.20
42 |Kcups - Bigelow Classic Green Tea 51 EA  |$12.24 $624.11| $15.99 $815.49| $14.39 $733.89) $15.81 $806.31) $15.88 $809.88| $16.49 $840.99| $18.59 $948.09) $22.00| $1,122.00| $13.40 $683.40| $17.83 $909.33
43 |Keyboard and Mouse combos 27 EA  |$34.99 $944.73| $78.14| $2,109.78($66.44| $1,793.88)|$86.98| $2,348.46| $34.16 $922.32| $89.09| $2,405.43)|$125.59| $3,390.93| $22.00 $594.00| $93.43| $2,522.61| $74.49| $2,011.23
44 |Nitrile Disposable Gloves 38 EA $5.40 $205.16] $8.99 $341.62| $3.88 $147.44| $5.43 $206.34) $9.01 $342.38)| $5.70 $216.60| $3.50 $133.00| $16.00 $608.00| $15.40 $585.20| $14.99 $569.62
45 | Scotch Heavy Duty Packing Tape, 1.88" x 54.6 yds., Clear, 6/Pack 37 EA $8.27 $306.14] $9.92 $367.04) $22.99 $850.63| $29.09| $1,076.33| $33.00| $1,221.00| $28.03| $1,037.11| $37.97| $1,404.89| $35.99| $1,331.63| $25.74 $952.38| $24.50 $906.50
46 |Paper - White - 8.5 x 11 - Recycled 15 EA  |$55.62 $834.30| $57.44 $861.60| $54.44 $816.60| $48.99 $734.85| $69.51| $1,042.65| $58.00 $870.00| $70.53| $1,057.95| $87.99| $1,319.85| $78.78| $1,181.70| $59.33 $889.95
47 _|Paper - White - 8.5 x 11 - TruRed 451 |EA  |$49.49 $22,318.86] $36.89| $16,637.39|$43.99| $19,839.49|$41.99|$18,937.49| $43.50|$19,618.50| $47.75|$21,535.25| $38.50| $17,363.50| $57.99| $26,153.49| $57.67|$26,009.17| $59.34|$26,762.34
48 | Dixie Ultra Pathways Heavy-Weight Paper Bowls, 20 oz., 125/Pack 42 EA  |$19.52 $819.98| $19.41 $815.22| $17.20 $722.40) $19.98 $839.16| $19.28 $809.76| $32.21| $1,352.82) $23.18 $973.56| $38.99| $1,637.58| $35.18| $1,477.56| $78.21| $3,284.82
49 |Staples Smooth Paper Clips, Jumbo, 100/Box 19 EA $2.95 $55.96] $0.99 $18.81| $1.00 $19.00{ $0.76 $14.44| $0.85 $16.15| $1.48 $28.12| $0.95 $18.05| $15.59 $296.21| $3.70 $70.30] $0.69 $13.11
50 |Perk™ Compostable Paper Plates, 9", White, 250/Pack 107 [EA  |$27.22 $2,912.54| $29.97| $3,206.79|$16.66| $1,782.62|$22.86| $2,446.02| $36.32| $3,886.24| $32.33| $3,459.31| $12.18| $1,303.26| $42.99| $4,599.93| $34.50| $3,691.50| $79.54| $8,510.78
51 |Scott Choose-A-Sheet Kitchen Roll Paper Towels, 1-ply, 102 Sheets/Roll, 12 Mega Rolls 110 [EA  |$15.54 $1,709.93| $18.68| $1,309.8416|$18.43| $2,027.30|$17.08| $1,878.80| $20.00| $2,200.00| $18.66| $2,052.60| $19.06| $2,096.60| $26.79| $2,946.90| $20.69| $2,275.90| $24.43| $2,687.30
52 |BIC Round Stic Xtra-Life Ballpoint Pen, Medium Point, Black Ink, 60/Pack 106 [EA $6.04 $640.42| $4.92 $521.52| $5.01 $531.06| $4.75 $503.50| $5.77 $611.62) $6.59 $698.54| $6.33 $670.98) $13.79| $1,461.74| $9.05 $959.30| $4.49 $475.94
53 |Pilot G2 Retractable Gel Pens, Fine Point, Blue Ink, Dozen 118 [EA $5.20 $613.13| $10.32| $1,217.76] $9.32| $1,099.76|$11.72| $1,382.96| $13.81| $1,629.58| $15.52| $1,831.36| $16.81| $1,983.58| $24.59| $2,901.62| $20.90( $2,466.20| $13.14| $1,550.52
54 |Sharpie Retractable Permanent Markers, Ultra Fine Tip, Black, 12/Pack 84 EA $5.53 $464.52| $17.16] $1441.44[$14.09| $1,183.56|$16.73| $1,405.32| $20.84| $1,750.56| $21.49| $1,805.16| $28.98| $2,434.32| $32.99| $2,771.16| $21.83| $1,833.72| $16.79| $1,410.36
55 |Perk™ Polystyrene Fork, Medium-Weight, White, 1000/Pac 46 EA |$16.79 $772.34] $18.99 $873.54| $13.30 $611.80| $15.66 $720.36| $20.28 $932.88| $18.91 $869.86) $4.83 $222.18| No Bid| $2,093.00{ $30.89| $1,420.94| $30.90| $1,421.40
56 |Perk™ Compostable PLA Fork, Medium-Weight, White, 300/Pack 5 EA $5.85 $29.24| $13.89 $69.45|$12.23 $61.15($13.73 $68.65| $28.00 $140.00| $20.68 $103.40| $4.09 $20.45| $35.99 $179.95| $25.43 $127.15| $2.75 $13.75
57 |Perk™ Polystyrene Knife, Medium-Weight, White, 1000/Pack 20 EA  |$16.99 $339.80| $15.89 $317.80| $16.53 $330.60) $17.32 $346.40| $18.59 $371.80| $24.16 $483.20| $43.75 $875.00| No Bid| $1,300.00| $48.09 $961.80| $31.10 $622.00
58 |Perk™ Compostable PLA Knife, Medium-Weight, White, 300/Pack 3 EA $5.04 $15.11| $13.89 $41.67|$13.58 $40.74| $14.47 $43.41| $12.49 $37.47| $19.04 $57.12| $4.09 $12.27] $40.99 $122.97| $33.77 $101.31| $3.75 $11.25
59 |Perk™ Polystyrene Spoon, Medium-Weight, White, 1000/Pack 40 EA  |$12.99 $519.60] $15.89 $635.60| $14.47 $578.80| $16.47 $658.80| $15.30 $612.00| $21.21 $848.40| $8.58 $343.20| No Bid| $1,924.00| $35.74| $1,429.60| $31.10| $1,244.00
60 |Perk™ Compostable PLA Spoon, Medium-Weight, White, 300/Pack 6 EA $5.85 $35.08| $13.89 $83.34| $12.62 $75.72( $13.37 $80.22| $11.44 $68.64| $15.95 $95.70| $4.09 $24.54| $35.99 $215.94| $25.43 $152.58| $2.75 $16.50
61 |Febreeze Plug In 54 EA $3.22 $173.88] $6.98 $376.92| $6.07 $327.78| $7.30 $394.20| $6.13 $331.02) $8.21 $443.34| $6.18 $333.72) $5.79 $312.66] $9.16 $494.64| $24.99| $1,349.46
62 |Staples Smooth 2-Pocket Paper Folder 25/box 59 EA |$12.86 $758.74| $6.88 $405.92| $5.74 $338.66| $6.30 $371.70| $8.49 $500.91) $5.78 $341.02) $9.73 $574.07) $21.79| $1,285.61| $19.56| $1,154.04]| $4.59 $270.81
63 |Post-its-3x 3 31 EA  |$1157 $358.79| $10.65 $330.15) $10.97 $340.07) $11.21 $347.51| $11.76 $364.56| $10.37 $321.47| $14.29 $442.99| $15.60 $483.60| $15.96 $494.76 $8.71 $270.01
64 |Post-its - 3 x 3 - Recycled 13 EA $8.15 $105.98| $6.12 $79.56| $5.24 $68.12| $4.64 $60.32| $5.48 $71.24| $7.58 $98.54| $16.95 $220.35)| $34.99 $454.87|  $9.26 $120.38| $7.85 $102.05
65 |Black N' Red 1-Subject Professional Notebooks, 8.25" x 11.75", Wide Ruled, 96 Sheets 35 EA $9.99 $349.65| $9.89 $346.15) $14.07 $492.45)| $12.29 $430.15| $13.89 $486.15| $17.13 $599.55| $18.08 $632.80| $12.99 $454.65| $21.07 $737.45| $10.72 $375.20
66 | TRU RED™ Large Soft Cover Project Planner Notebook 23 EA |$10.74 $247.02| $4.61 $106.03| $4.49 $103.27| $4.98 $114.54| $7.68 $176.64) $9.07 $208.61) $8.59 $197.57| $15.00 $345.00| $11.60 $266.80| $13.29 $305.67
67 |Staples Thermal Cash Register/POS Rolls, 3 1/8" x 230', 50/Carton 83 EA  |$57.99 $4,813.17|$112.46|  $9,334.18| $73.84| $6,128.72|$72.79| $6,041.57|$137.94| $11,449.02| $122.75| $10,188.25| $217.48| $18,050.84| $18.00| $1,494.00{$170.99|$14,192.17 | $195.99| $16,267.17
68 |Staples Steno Pads, 6" x 9", Gregg Ruled, Green, 80 Sheets/Pad, Dozen Pads/Pack 46 EA  |$25.19 $1,158.65| $9.86 $453.56| $5.51 $253.46| $8.61 $396.06) $6.31 $290.26| $13.64 $627.44) $1.43 $65.78| $27.59| $1,269.14| $21.79| $1,002.34| $7.70 $354.20
69 | TRU RED™ Steno Pad, 6" x 9", Gregg Ruled, Kraft, 80 Sheets/Pad, Dozen Pads/Pack 2 EA  |$19.79 $39.58| $16.48 $32.96| $8.97 $17.94| $8.84 $17.68| $7.04 $14.08| No Bid $71.96| $1.67 $3.34| $25.99 $51.98| $21.79 $43.58| $10.35 $20.70
70 |Staples Basic-Duty File Box, Lift Off Lid, Letter/Legal, White/Black, 10/Pack 65 EA  ]$23.33 $1516.45| $15.98| $1,038.70|$18.31| $1,190.15|$16.06| $1,043.90| $16.02| $1,041.30| $20.89| $1,357.85| $42.38| $2,754.70| $23.00| $1,495.00| $25.12| $1,632.80| $15.41| $1,001.65
71 |NJoy Sugar, 3 Canisters/Pack 102 |EA  |$12.30 $1,254.60] $6.78 $691.56| $7.03 $717.06| $6.15 $627.30| $7.46 $760.92) $9.97| $1,016.94) $7.47 $761.94| $14.99| $1,528.98| $14.85| $1,514.70| $9.05 $923.10
72 |Staples Invisible Tape, 3/4" x 1,296", 12/Pack 21 EA $4.66 $97.94| $6.82 $143.22| $8.16 $171.36| $7.56 $158.76| $15.29 $321.09| $6.68 $140.28| $20.77 $436.17| $20.00 $420.00| $15.44 $324.24| $22.63 $475.23
73 |Tissue (Kleenex) 126 |EA  |$1257 $1,584.30| $15.16| $1,910.16|$11.58| $1,459.08|$11.93| $1,503.18| $11.41| $1,437.66| $14.32| $1,804.32| $15.63| $1,969.38| $6.49 $817.74| $18.12| $2,283.12| $13.97| $1,760.22
74 | Verbatim PinStripe 32GB USB 2.0 Type A Flash Drive, Black, 10/Pack 47 EA  |$27.60 $1,296.97| $32.33| $1,519.51|$26.45| $1,243.15|$33.06| $1,553.82| $38.96| $1,831.12| $54.53| $2,562.91| $58.81| $2,764.07| $50.00| $2,350.00| $67.57| $3,175.79| $32.99| $1,550.53
75 |Quartet Glass Dry-Erase Whiteboard, 0.5' x 1.5' 52 EA  ]$28.00 $1,456.00| $23.38| $1,215.76|$25.60| $1,331.20|$26.86] $1,396.72| $30.94| $1,608.88| $28.72| $1,493.44| $41.21| $2,142.92| $55.00| $2,860.00| $33.47| $1,740.44| $27.99| $1,455.48
Total: $77,618.51 $81,275.7616 $79,660.52 $83,056.24 $94,831.39 $98,681.58 $100,683.90 $111,288.29 $119,712.75 $132,108.33




Exhibit 2
8497 - Pricing Comparison for Office Supplies

Ameri Trading

Greenville Enterprises

EN Consulting

Vendor Name:|  Company LLC Mangwenya LLC LLC (US Army) Solutions LLC The Notary Geek
Line # Description OTY|UOM| Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended Unit Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended
1 [Appointment Books - 8"x12" Monthly planner 60 EA $27.48| $1,648.80| $16.00 $960.00 $22.50 $1,350.00| $20.00| $1,200.00| $30.14| $1,808.40
2 Batteries AA - Duracell 40 EA $35.07| $1,402.80| $32.00( $1,280.00 $26.50 $1,060.00] $50.00| $2,000.00| $52.98| $2,119.20
3 Batteries AAA - Duracell 32 EA $35.82| $1,146.24| $31.00 $992.00 $16.50 $528.00| $50.00| $1,600.00| $43.38| $1,388.16
4 Binder Clips - medium 15 EA $21.16 $317.40| $12.00 $180.00 $7.50 $112.50| $30.00 $450.00| $29.89 $448.35
5 Binders - Staples 1" 3-Ring View 15 EA $6.38 $95.70 $4.00 $60.00 $14.50 $217.50| $6.00 $90.00| $11.58 $173.70
6 Binders - Avery Heavy Duty 2" 3-Ring View 20 EA $16.60 $332.00| $11.09 $221.80 $15.78 $315.60| $17.00 $340.00| $26.18 $523.60
7 Binders - Avery Heavy Duty 3" 3-Ring View 19 EA $11.00 $209.00| $15.20 $288.80 $17.50 $332.50| $17.00 $323.00| $21.69 $412.11
8 Bottled Creamer - Coffeemate French Vanilla 24 EA $22.21 $533.04| $24.20 $580.80 $14.50 $348.00| $20.00 $480.00| $44.38| $1,065.12
9 Bottled Water - Nestle Pure Life 8 0z 31 EA $15.06 $466.86| $12.20 $378.20 $22.50 $697.50| $13.00 $403.00| $30.18 $935.58
10 |Bottled Water - True Clear 18 EA $20.78 $374.04]| $9.40 $169.20 $18.50 $333.00| $15.00 $270.00| $45.78 $824.04
11 |House of Doolittle 22" x 17" Monthly Desk Pad Calendar 56 EA $17.48 $978.88| $18.75| $1,050.00 $25.50 $1,428.00| $20.00| $1,120.00| $31.78| $1,779.68
12 |Clasp Envelopes - 9 x 12 19 EA $22.65 $430.35| $14.21 $269.99 $35.00 $665.00| $20.00 $380.00| $33.18 $630.42
13 |Clasp Envelopes - 6 x 9 14 EA $32.88 $460.32| $15.20 $212.80 $20.35 $284.90| $30.00 $420.00| $25.58 $358.12
14 |Dixie PerfecTouch Paper Hot Cups, 16 0z 61 EA $17.15| $1,046.15| $75.98| $4,634.78 $34.60 $2,110.60| $15.00 $915.00| $26.58| $1,621.38
15 [Coffee Cups - Perk™ Compostable Paper Hot Cup, 16 Oz. 44 EA $39.99| $1,759.56| $53.36| $2,347.84 $72.50 $3,190.00| $35.00| $1,540.00| $61.38| $2,700.72
16 [Coffee Cups - Perk™ Paper Hot Cup, 12 Oz 36 EA $54.99| $1,979.64| $49.87| $1,795.32 $32.50 $1,170.00| $50.00| $1,800.00|$131.98| $4,751.28
17 [Coffee Cups - Perk™ Compostable Paper Hot Cup, 12 Oz 9 EA $65.99 $593.91| $32.18 $289.62 $21.50 $193.50| $50.00 $450.00| $77.78 $700.02
18 | Coffee Stirrers - Eco-Products Brown Wood Stirrers, 1000/Pack 17 |EA $14.30| $243.10| $16.21| $275.57| $29.75| $505.75| $13.00( $221.00| $22.38| $380.46
19 [Cold Cups - Perk™ Compostable Plastic Cold Cup, 16 Oz 41 EA $87.59| $3,591.19| $69.15| $2,835.15 $65.00 $2,665.00| $70.00| $2,870.00|$124.58| $5,107.78
20 __|Scotch Indoor Mounting Squares, 1" x 1" 59 EA $6.12 $361.08| $48.12| $2,839.08 $14.75 $870.25| $5.00 $295.00| $7.78 $459.02
21 |Staples Correction Tape, White, 10/Pack 38 EA $21.32 $810.16| $16.18 $614.84 $28.70 $1,090.60| $15.00 $570.00| $23.58 $896.04
22 |Creamer cups - Coffeemate French Vanilla 100 [EA $53.56| $5,356.00| $52.69| $5,269.00 $29.50 $2,950.00| $40.00| $4,000.00| $71.38| $7,138.00
23 |Creamer cups - Coffeemate Hazlenut 57 EA $26.72| $1,523.04| $21.17| $1,206.69 $40.00( $2,280.00| $15.00 $855.00| $38.58| $2,199.06
24 | Creamer cups - Coffeemate Original 85 EA $44.32| $3,767.20| $22.47| $1,909.95 $45.50 $3,867.50| $55.00| $4,675.00| $59.78| $5,081.30
25 |Creamer Cups - Minimoos half and half 24 EA $23.75 $570.00| $19.75 $474.00 $48.00 $1,152.00| $35.00 $840.00| $31.18 $748.32
26 |Purell Automatic Wall Mounted Soap Dispensers 53 EA $33.32| $1,765.96|$120.00| $6,360.00 $14.75 $781.75| $25.00| $1,325.00| $42.78| $2,267.34
27 _|Lysol Disinfectant Spray, Crisp Linen Scent, 19 oz. 21 EA $12.10 $254.10| $14.56 $305.76 $15.00 $315.00| $15.00 $315.00| $16.98 $356.58
28 | Disinfectant Wipes - Clorox 83 EA $15.40| $1,278.20| $13.78| $1,143.74 $8.50 $705.50| $15.00| $1,245.00| $24.58| $2,040.14
29 |TRU RED Durable Dry Erase Eraser, Black 16 EA $3.84 $61.44| $7.00 $112.00 $6.50 $104.00) $6.00 $96.00| $6.98 $111.68
30 |Envelopes - Size 10 30 EA $27.03 $810.90| $30.09 $902.70 $48.25 $1,447.50| $42.00| $1,260.00| $55.89| $1,676.70
31 |Gatorade - Fruit Punch 72 EA $48.28| $3,476.16| $3.17 $228.24 $45.00 $3,240.00| $28.00| $2,016.00| $77.78| $5,600.16
32 | Ground Coffee - Dunkin Donuts 10 EA $28.37 $283.70| $16.09 $160.90 $28.50 $285.00| $20.00 $200.00| $35.78 $357.80
33 |Ground Coffee - Folgers 119 |EA $14.40| $1,713.60| $12.89| $1,533.91 $26.50 $3,153.50| $15.00| $1,785.00| $19.34| $2,301.46
34 | Ground Coffee - Starbucks 7 EA $27.69 $193.83| $13.47 $94.29 $62.50 $437.50| $30.00 $210.00| $32.18 $225.26
35 |PURE 12 ozLL Advanced Gel Hand Sanitizer 189 |EA $8.35| $1,578.15| $5.87| $1,109.43 $17.00( $3,213.00] $6.00| $1,134.00| $11.18| $2,113.02
36 | Dial Basics Liquid Hand Soap 7.5 oz 28 EA $4.41 $123.48| $3.28 $91.84 $50.00 $1,400.00| $5.00 $140.00) $4.98 $139.44
37 |Logitech H390 Computer Headset, Over-the-Head 17 EA $20.57 $349.69| $26.78 $455.26 $42.00 $714.00| $30.00 $510.00| $33.78 $574.26
38 [Sharpie Tank Highlighter, Chisel Tip, Assorted, Dozen 21 [EA $9.92| $208.32| $22.17| $465.57| $23.00| $483.00| $13.00| $273.00| $11.18| $234.78
39 |Kcups Coffee - Dunkin Donuts 29 EA $74.80| $2,169.20| $46.18| $1,339.22 $26.00 $754.00| $50.00| $1,450.00|$119.78| $3,473.62
40 |Kcups Coffee - Green Mountain 123 |EA $19.79| $2/434.17| $18.10| $2,226.30 $37.50 $4,612.50| $15.00| $1,845.00| $28.38| $3,490.74
41 |Kcups Coffee - Starbucks 104 |EA $27.49| $2,858.96| $27.01| $2,809.04 $36.00 $3,744.00| $20.00| $2,080.00| $40.78| $4,241.12
42 |Kcups - Bigelow Classic Green Tea 51 EA $17.59 $897.09| $20.14| $1,027.14 $28.00 $1,428.00| $13.00 $663.00| $30.98| $1,579.98
43 |Keyboard and Mouse combos 27 EA $98.98| $2,672.46| $24.12 $651.24 $50.00 $1,350.00]|$110.00| $2,970.00| $140.58| $3,795.66
44 |Nitrile Disposable Gloves 38 EA $16.49 $626.62| $24.14 $917.32 $15.50 $589.00| $22.00 $836.00| $16.78 $637.64
45 | Scotch Heavy Duty Packing Tape, 1.88" x 54.6 yds., Clear, 6/Pack 37 EA $34.10| $1,261.70| $32.14| $1,189.18 $34.00 $1,258.00| $30.00| $1,110.00| $45.38| $1,679.06
46 |Paper - White - 8.5 x 11 - Recycled 15 EA $77.54| $1,163.10| $72.98| $1,094.70 $25.00 $375.00| $95.00| $1,425.00|{$107.18| $1,607.70
47 _|Paper - White - 8.5 x 11 - TruRed 451 [EA $60.49] $27,280.99| $73.20( $33,013.20 $27.00{ $12,177.00| $65.00| $29,315.00| $86.98| $39,227.98
48 | Dixie Ultra Pathways Heavy-Weight Paper Bowls, 20 oz., 125/Pack 42 EA $37.80| $1,587.60| $25.79| $1,083.18 $40.00 $1,680.00| $45.00| $1,890.00| $45.58| $1,914.36
49 |Staples Smooth Paper Clips, Jumbo, 100/Box 19 EA $3.99 $75.81| $4.12 $78.28 $5.50 $104.50| $6.00 $114.00) $5.26 $99.94
50 |Perk™ Compostable Paper Plates, 9", White, 250/Pack 107 _|EA $42.35| $4,531.45| $34.20| $3,659.40 $45.00 $4,815.00| $40.00| $4,280.00| $66.98| $7,166.86
51 |Scott Choose-A-Sheet Kitchen Roll Paper Towels, 1-ply, 102 Sheets/Roll, 12 Mega Rolls 110 |EA $26.50| $2,915.00| $39.20| $4,312.00 $32.10 $3,531.00 $25.00| $2,750.00| $40.18| $4,419.80
52 |BIC Round Stic Xtra-Life Ballpoint Pen, Medium Point, Black Ink, 60/Pack 106 |EA $9.99| $1,058.94| $7.21 $764.26 $15.00( $1,590.00| $15.00| $1,590.00| $11.18| $1,185.08
53 |Pilot G2 Retractable Gel Pens, Fine Point, Blue Ink, Dozen 118 [EA $22.80| $2,690.40| $14.21| $1,676.78 $25.50 $3,009.00| $18.00| $2,124.00| $20.18| $2,381.24
54 |Sharpie Retractable Permanent Markers, Ultra Fine Tip, Black, 12/Pack 84 EA $30.99| $2,603.16| $36.00| $3,024.00 $35.10 $2,948.40| $30.00| $2,520.00| $31.58| $2,652.72
55 |Perk™ Polystyrene Fork, Medium-Weight, White, 1000/Pac 46 EA $30.80| $1,416.80| $24.29| $1,117.34 $45.50 $2,093.00| $35.00| $1,610.00| $30.38| $1,397.48
56 |Perk™ Compostable PLA Fork, Medium-Weight, White, 300/Pack 5 EA $27.16 $135.80| $18.29 $91.45 $40.10 $200.50| $35.00 $175.00| $40.38 $201.90
57 |Perk™ Polystyrene Knife, Medium-Weight, White, 1000/Pack 20 EA $46.96 $939.20| $47.00 $940.00 $62.45 $1,249.00| $65.00| $1,300.00| $34.18 $683.60
58 |Perk™ Compostable PLA Knife, Medium-Weight, White, 300/Pack 3 EA $36.10 $108.30| $35.00 $105.00 $48.50 $145.50| $40.00 $120.00| $35.18 $105.54
59 |Perk™ Polystyrene Spoon, Medium-Weight, White, 1000/Pack 40 EA $38.16| $1,526.40| $35.00| $1,400.00 $48.10 $1,924.00| $40.00| $1,600.00| $30.38| $1,215.20
60 |Perk™ Compostable PLA Spoon, Medium-Weight, White, 300/Pack 6 EA $31.78 $190.68| $18.12 $108.72 $42.50 $255.00| $30.00 $180.00| $53.18 $319.08
61 |Febreeze Plug In 54 EA $10.15 $548.10|  $4.20 $226.80 $8.50 $459.00| $15.00 $810.00| $17.18 $927.72
62 |Staples Smooth 2-Pocket Paper Folder 25/box 59 EA $21.32| $1,257.88| $11.20 $660.80 $27.50 $1,622.50| $25.00| $1,475.00| $20.98| $1,237.82
63 |Post-its-3x 3 31 EA $16.30 $505.30| $13.78 $427.18 $20.00 $620.00| $25.00 $775.00| $20.78 $644.18
64 |Post-its - 3 x 3 - Recycled 13 EA $11.67 $151.71| $10.59 $137.67 $40.50 $526.50|  $5.00 $65.00| $14.38 $186.94
65 |Black N' Red 1-Subject Professional Notebooks, 8.25" x 11.75", Wide Ruled, 96 Sheets 35 EA $19.80 $693.00| $24.12 $844.20 $30.50 $1,067.50| $25.00 $875.00| $19.18 $671.30
66 | TRU RED™ Large Soft Cover Project Planner Notebook 23 EA $21.33 $490.59| $12.24 $281.52 $32.50 $747.50| $15.00 $345.00| $32.78 $753.94
67 |Staples Thermal Cash Register/POS Rolls, 3 1/8" x 230', 50/Carton 83 EA $145.99)$12,117.17)| $182.20| $15,122.60| $225.00| $18,675.00| $200.00| $16,600.00| $193.38| $16,050.54
68 |Staples Steno Pads, 6" x 9", Gregg Ruled, Green, 80 Sheets/Pad, Dozen Pads/Pack 46 EA $33.76| $1,552.96| $18.20 $837.20 $35.50( $1,633.00{ $25.00| $1,150.00| $57.38| $2,639.48
69 | TRU RED™ Steno Pad, 6" x 9", Gregg Ruled, Kraft, 80 Sheets/Pad, Dozen Pads/Pack 2 EA $24.74 $49.48| $18.20 $36.40 $35.00 $70.00| $25.00 $50.00| $35.98 $71.96
70 |Staples Basic-Duty File Box, Lift Off Lid, Letter/Legal, White/Black, 10/Pack 65 EA $29.33| $1,906.45| $15.18 $986.70 $40.56( $2,636.40| $35.00| $2,275.00| $43.58| $2,832.70
71 |NJoy Sugar, 3 Canisters/Pack 102 [EA $15.32| $1,562.64| $9.20 $938.40 $14.50( $1,479.00 $20.00| $2,040.00| $20.18| $2,058.36
72 |Staples Invisible Tape, 3/4" x 1,296", 12/Pack 21 EA $15.73 $330.33| $10.02 $210.42 $23.40 $491.40( $20.00 $420.00| $17.18 $360.78
73 |Tissue (Kleenex) 126 [EA $20.45| $2,576.70| $2.10 $264.60 $8.50| $1,071.00| $25.00{ $3,150.00| $34.58| $4,357.08
74 | Verbatim PinStripe 32GB USB 2.0 Type A Flash Drive, Black, 10/Pack 47 EA $72.32| $3,399.04| $67.89| $3,190.83 $65.50( $3,078.50| $80.00| $3,760.00| $58.78| $2,762.66
75 |Quartet Glass Dry-Erase Whiteboard, 0.5' x 1.5' 52 EA $36.49| $1,897.48| $34.20| $1,778.40 $55.75 $2,899.00| $40.00| $2,080.00| $46.98| $2,442.96
Total: $132,276.65 $132,670.54 $132,906.15 $136,433.00 $183,723.20




