
Accelleron US Inc. 

dba ABB Inc

Motor-Services Hugo 

Stamp, Inc.

Deer Park, TX Fort Lauderdale, FL

Line # Description UOM Unit Unit

1 TURBOCHARGER COMPLETE A175 EA $420,463.71 $420,463.71-no bid

2 SPEED PICKUP EA $4,205.40 $5,918.17

3 NOZZLE RING ASSEMBLY A175 EA $36,917.18 $52,799.01

4 TURBINE DIFFUSER A175 EA $11,884.45 $16,724.77

5 DIFFUSER A175 EA $27,968.03 $39,358.90

6 SPARE PART SET A175 EA $12,685.18 $12,685.18-no bid

7 SPARE PART SET A175 EA $24,102.37 $24,102.37-no bid

8 SPARE PART SET A175 EA $3,171.56 $3,171.56-no bid

9 SPARE PART SET A175 EA $634.52 $634.52-no bid

10 TURBOCHARGER A175 INSPECTION EA $17,533.00 $4,340.00-labor only

11 TURBOCHARGER A175 OVERHAUL EA $500,000.00 $4,340.00-labor only

12 FIELD SERVICE, LABOR, TRAVEL AND ACCOMMODATION HR $11,504.00 $44,205.00-labor only

13 PERFORM 16,000 HR TURBOCHARGER MAINTENANCE INTERVAL HR $7,286.40 $4,340.00-labor only

$1,078,355.80 $633,083.19

Item #
Accelleron US Inc. 

dba ABB Inc

Motor-Services Hugo 

Stamp, Inc.

1 24.00 18.00

2 24.00 18.00

3 16.00 10.67

4 11.74 20.00

75.74 66.67

Total:

Respondent's Business Name:

Principal Place of Business (City and State):

Exhibit 2

RFP 8816 - Pricing Evaluation for DEC Turbo Replacement, Parts, and Service

Evaluation

Standard Criteria

Delivery/Project Schedule - 30%

Compliance with Specifications - 30%

Probable Performance - 20%

Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 20%

Total Score:


