
Titan Utility 

Services, LLC

LND Technical 

Services

Texas Electric 

Cooperatives

Tickfaw, LA Houston, TX Georgetown, TX

Line # Description UOM Bid Bid Bid

2
HB4150 Hazard Assessment – Clearances and Slack Span,Electric Hazard Assessment 

Training per TX State HB4150 Per Session $2,050.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

3
Operating Instructions COM-002-4 (3-part communication),NERC/APPA utility 

communication for verification of lock out tag out. Per Session $2,050.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

4
NERC Standards,NERC required training for System Operators, Linemen, Substations Techs, 

and Meter Techs Per Session no bid-$19,500 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

5
APPA Safety Manual,Summary training of the APPA Safety Manual for Linemen, Substations 

Techs, and Meter Techs Per Session $2,050.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

6 Electric Utility Distribution Systems (Theory and Equipment) Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

7 Electric Utility Transmission Systems (Theory and Equipment) Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

8
Areal Rescue Pole Top/Bucket Training,Training and testing the annual practical evaluation of 

Bucket/Pole Top rescue for Electric utilities. Per Session $2,250.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

9
Areal Rescue Pole Top/Bucket Train-the-Trainer,Train trainers to conduct the training and 

testing of the annual practical evaluation of Bucket/Pole Top rescue for Electric utilities. Per Session $6,000.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

10 Aerial Lift Device Operator Training Per Session $2,250.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

11 Basic Pole Climbing Per Session $10,000.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

12 Apprentice Lineman or Lineman refresher- simulated energized training Per Session $10,000.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

13 AWARE Driver Training- Classroom and/or Classroom and Driving Per Session $3,000.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

14 Capacitors and Step Voltage Regulators Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

15 CPR – First Aid – AED Certification Per Session $2,400.00 $4,000.00 $19,500.00

16 Digger Derrick Training Per Session $2,250.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

17 Effective Cover-up,Electric Utility line cover up training. Per Session $2,250.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

18 Electrical Theory Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

19 Rubber Gloves/Sleeves and Cover Up inspection and use Per Session $2,050.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

20 Follow the Leader- How good leaders create a positive workplace Per Session $7,000.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

21 Forklift Certification Per Session $2,795.00 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

22 Metering- Self-contained and Instrument Rated Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

23 Protective Devices- Arresters, Cutouts, Fusing, Sectionalizes, and Reclosers Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

24 ATO/Vista Gears,Basic function, safety practices, and industry best practice of equipment Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

25 Single Phase Transformers Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

26 Substation Entry and Basic Operation Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

Respondent's Business Name:

Principal Place of Business (City and State):
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27 Three Phase Transformers (Advanced) Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

28 Transformer Refresher and Connections Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

29 NFPA 70E – Arc Flash Per Session $2,250.00 $10,300.00 $19,500.00

30 OSHA 10 Hour Training Per Session no bid-$19,500 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

31 OSHA 30 Hour Training Per Session no bid-$19,500 no bid-$19,500 $19,500.00

Total $143,895.00 $440,700.00 $585,000.00

Item #

Titan Utility 

Services, LLC

LND Technical 

Services

Texas Electric 

Cooperatives

1 16.00 9.33 6.67

2 22.00 12.00 16.00

3 17.33 9.33 10.67

4 30.00 9.80 7.38

85.33 40.46 40.72Total Score:

Scoring Criteria

Ability to Schedule Training - 20%

Compliance with Specifications - 30%

Probable Performance - 20%

Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 30%

Evaluation


