Exhibit 2

IFB 8951 - Bid Tabulation for Signal Heads, Detectors, Crossing Systems, and Misc.

Consolidated Traffic | GENERAL TRAFFIC MoboTrex. Inc
Respondent's Business Name: Controls, Inc. EQUIPMENT CORP ’
Principal Place of Business (City and State): Arlington, TX Newburgh, NY Davenport, IA
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno | QTY | UOM Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended
1 SECTION A: SIGNAL AND PEDESTRIAN HEADS
5 |3 —SECTION BLACK POLYCARBONATE SIGNAL ~ IM69465, M19271, M17910
HEAD WITH BLACK VISORS, BLACK LOUVERED [SA103A1C11BBB00-00
METAL BACKPLATE, READY FOR LENSES E1692P43-14 30 EA $320.98( $25,678.40 $210.00 $16,800.00
3 SECTION BLACK POLYCARBONAYE SIGNAL
2 ALT1 {HEAD WITH BLACK VISORS BLACL LOUVERED  |General Traffic Equipment
METAL BACKPLATE LED READY Corp T40H-POLY-Y-EMPTY-T-B-B-B 80 EA $275.00| $22,000.00
3 |4-SECTION BLACK POLYCARBONATE SIGNAL  [M66151, M19271, M17975
HEAD WITH BLACK VISORS, BLACK LOUVERED [SA104A1C11BBB00-00
METAL BACKPLATE, READY FOR LENSES E1692P45-14 30 EA $383.98( $11,519.40 $272.00{ $8,160.00
4 SECTION BLACK POLYCARBONATE SIGNAL
3 ALT1|HEAD WITH BLACK VISORS BLACK LOUVERED |GENERAL TRAFFIC
METAL BACKPLATES LED READY EQUIPMENT CORP T40H-POLY-Y-EMPTY-T-B-B-B 30 EA $384.00{ $11,520.00
4 |5 ~SECTION BLACK POLYCARBONATE SIGNAL
HEAD WITH BLACK VISORS, BLACK LOUVERED
METAL BACKPLATE, READY FOR LENSES 20 EA $506.98| $10,139.60 $340.00{ $6,800.00
5 SECTION BLACK POLYCARBONATE SIGNAL
4 ALT1 [HEAD WITH BLACK VISORS BLACK LOUVERED [GENERAL TRAFFIC
METAL BACKPLATE LED READY EQUIPMENT CORP T50H-POLY-T-EMPTY-T-B-B-B 20 EA $492.00{  $9,840.00
PEDESTRIAN HEAD, RIGHT SIDE MOUNT, BLACK
5 |POLYCARBONATE, ALUMINUMCLAM SHELL
MOUNT, READY FOR LED LENS 30 EA $143.98| $4,319.40] $198.00[ $5,940.00|  $205.00| $6,150.00
6 DOUBLE FACE ILSN 6feetx18inches
CP618DTHNNAADS ONLY 20 EA $1,782.98| $35,659.60] $4,550.00| $91,000.00| $4,550.00 $91,000.00
SINGLE FACE ILSN 6'x18" / CP618SRDNNAAG1
7 ONLY SOUTHERN MFG-CP618SRDNNAAG! ONLY 20 ea $1,640.98| $32,819.60] $4.450.00| $89,000.00| $4,450.00| $89,000.00
8 |SECTION B: DETECTORS
9 DETECTOR OPTICOM #721 #721 SINGLE
CHANNEL CTS#110247 78-8095-3853-7 / CTS#110247 30 EA $7,598.00| $22,769.40] $758.98| $22,769.40| $758.98| $22,769.40
10 DETECTOR OPTICOM #722 # 722 DUAL CHANNEL
CTS#110247 78-8095-3854-5 / CTS#110247 10 EA $1,008.98| $10,089.80] $1,008.98| $10,089.80| $1,008.98| $10,089.80
1 DETECTOR OPTICOM #764 PHASE SELECTOR
MULTIMODE #764 76-1000-1054-0 / CTS#110610-MM 10 EA $3,303.98| $33,039.80] $3,303.98| $33,039.80| $3,303.98| $33,039.80
12 DETECTOR OPTICOM CLAMP SPAN WIRE CLAMP
#10100 CTS# 101001 10 EA $18.98 $189.80 $18.98 $189.80 $18.98 $189.80
13 DETECTOR, NARROW HUB $3M, 34inches HOLE,
500B #201011 CTS #201011 10 EA $21.98 $219.80 $21.98 $219.80 $21.98 $219.80
14 DETECTOR, OPTICOM CABLE / #3M # 138 (1000'
SPOOL) GTT MODEL 138 2000 [FT $0.20 $400.00 $0.20 $400.00 $0.20 $400.00
DETECTOR, NARROW HUB $3M, 34inches HOLE,
15 500B #201011 10 EA $21.98 $219.80 $21.98 $219.80 $21.98 $219.80
16 |SECTION C: CROSSING SYSTEMS
17 PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SYSTEMS SEE
TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS 10 EA $5,778.98| $57,789.80| $5,778.98| $57,789.80| $5,778.98| $57,789.80
18 |POLARA NAVIGATOR CCU” ICCU-S2 POLARA ICCU-S2 10 EA $2,713.98| $27,139.80] $2,713.98| $27,139.80| $2,713.98] $27,139.80




Exhibit 2
IFB 8951 - Bid Tabulation for Signal Heads, Detectors, Crossing Systems, and Misc.

Consolidated Traffic GENERAL TRAFFIC
MoboTrex, Inc

Respondent's Business Name: Controls, Inc. EQUIPMENT CORP
Principal Place of Business (City and State): Arlington, TX Newburgh, NY Davenport, IA

19 POLARA NAVIGATOR PB STATION”

9inchesX15inches, CTC 87-INS23TNO-B CTC 87-INS23TNO-B 50 EA $524.98( $26,249.00] $524.98( $26,249.00( $524.98| $26,249.00
20 SCHOOL FLASHER, ASSEMBLY KIT” 2

BATTERYRADIOAP22 10 EA $3,916.98| $39,169.80] $3,916.98| $39,169.80| $3,916.98| $39,169.80
21 |DC PEDESTRIAN CROSSING MASTER

WPUSHBUTTON 1-2 REMOTES PNS10-600008M PNS10-600008M 10 EA $2,435.98| $24,359.80| $2,435.98| $24,359.80| $2,435.98| $24,359.80
2 DC PEDESTRIAN CROSSING REMOTE

W/PUSHBUTTON / PNS10-600008R PNS10-600008R 10 EA $2,875.98| $28,759.80| $2,875.98| $28,759.80| $2,875.98| $28,759.80

EDGE LIGHT PEDESTRIAN SIGN WALKING LEFT
23 |HV GREEN, NO LINES 30inchesx30inches PNS10-
ELWI11-2K W11-2 PNS10-ELW11-2K W11-2 10 EA $1,081.98| $10,819.80] $1,081.98| $10,819.80| $1,081.98| $10,819.80

EDGE LIGHT ARROW POINTING LEFT TO
24 |CROSSING SIGN 24inchesx12inches PNS10-SIELW 16
7P24-GK W16-7P PNS10-SIELW16-7P24-GK W16-7P 10 EA $1,084.98| $10,849.80] $1,084.98| $10,849.80| $1,084.98| $10,849.80

EDGE LIGHT PEDESTRIAN SIGN WALKING LEFT
25 |HV GREEN, NO LINES 36inchesx36inches PNS10-
ELW11-36K W11-2 PNS10-ELW11-36K W11-2 10 EA $1,115.98| $11,159.80] $1,115.98| $11,159.80| $1,115.98| $11,159.80

26 |WWI11-2 EDGE LIGHT PEDESTRIAN WALKING
LEFT HV YELLOW 36"x36" / PNS10-ELW11-2LFK PNS10-ELW11-2LFK 10 EA $1,115.98| $11,159.80] $1,115.98| $11,159.80( $1,115.98| $11,159.80

27 |SECTION D: MISCELLANEOUS

BATTERY, ALPHACELL 220GXL SILVER ALLOY

2 GEL, 12V, 109AH 220GXL 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29 |BATTERY, SOLAR 8G30H-DEKA 12V, 108AH 8G30H-DEKA 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30 CABLE, 143 STR CU 14GA 1000feetSPOOL,

ANIXTER #2A-1403 #2A-1403 1000 |[FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 CABLE, CONTROL MCS5E 4PR 24AWG 1000feetSP,

BELDEN#7919A 0105000 BELDEN#7919A 0105000 10000 |FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 CABLE, TRAFFIC SIGNAL 7C-14AWG 1000feetRL 5000 |[FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 ENCLOSURE, 12inchesx20inchesx 18inches LxWxD

PEM-1220-18PC PEM-1220-18PC 10 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
34 CABLE, 14AWG 20 CONDUCTOR, ISMA 1420 STR

20-1 2500feet REEL 2500 |[FT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 |MOUNTING RECEIVER / PNS10-FLASHCUBE PNS10-FLASHCUBE 20 EA $2,082.98| $41,659.60] $2,082.98| $41,659.60| $2,082.98| $41,659.60
36 POLE MOUNT 2 7/8" to 3" OD POLE / PNS10-503396-

3 PNS10-503396-3 20 EA $162.98 $3,259.60 $162.98] $3,259.60 $162.98 $3,259.60
37 30-WATT SOLAR PANEL ASSY W/MOUNT AND

WIRING / PNS10-502400-30 PNS10-502400-30 20 EA $400.98( $8,019.60 $400.98| $8,019.60 $400.98| $8,019.60
38 22AMP GEL CELL BATTERY / PNS10-506484-18 PNS10-506484-18 20 EA $105.98( $2,119.60 $105.98 $2,119.60 $105.98 $2,119.60

39 |15'SPUN ALUMINUM POLE W/BASE, COLLAR,

AND ANCHOR BOLTS / PNS10-POLE15SPALASSY PNS10-POLE15SSPALASSY 20 EA $1,226.98| $24,539.60| $1,226.98| $24,539.60| $1,226.98| $24,539.60
40 CABINET, 20W SOLAR PANEL, 22AH BATTERY

ASSEMBLY / PNS10-S1ELASSY PNS10-SIELASSY 20 EA $378.98| $7,579.60|] $378.98| $7,579.60 $378.98| $7,579.60
41 R1-1 STOP EDGE LIGHT SIGN (30"x30", 8LEDS) /

PNS10-ELR1-1 30K PNS10-ELR1-1 30K 20 EA $1,368.98| $27,379.60] $1,368.98| $27,379.60| $1,368.98| $27,379.60




Exhibit 2
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Consolidated Traffic | GENERAL TRAFFIC MoboTrex. Inc
Respondent's Business Name: Controls, Inc. EQUIPMENT CORP ’
Principal Place of Business (City and State): Arlington, TX Newburgh, NY Davenport, IA
0 R1-1 STOP EDGE LIGHT SIGN (36"x36", 8LEDS) /
PNS10-ELR1-1 36K PNS10-ELR1-1 36K 20 EA $1,401.98| $28,039.60] $1,401.98| $28,039.60| $1,401.98| $28,039.60
BATTERY CABINET INCLUDED PANEL NO. 2,
43 |[REGULATOR AND 4.5" UBOLT MOUNT
18W"X17H"X14" (PNS10-503333K) PNS10-503333K 5 EA $1,220.98| $6,104.90] $1,220.98| $6,104.90| $1,220.98| $6,104.90
44 40W SOLAR PANEL ASSY INCL SIDE POLE
MOUNT AND WIRING (PNS10-SP40) PNS10-SP40 5 EA $320.98( $1,604.90 $320.98| $1,604.90 $320.98 $1,604.90
45 104 AMP HOUR BATTERY (PNS10-500645-104) PNS10-500645-104 5 EA $452.98( $2,264.90 $452.98| $2,264.90 $452.98 $2,264.90
46 12" SIGNAL HEADS POLY YELLOW (1,2 OR 3 PER
FLASHER) (PNS10-SIGPY) PNS10-SIGPY 20 EA $237.98 $4,759.60 $237.98| $4,759.60 $237.98[ $4,759.60
47 12" AMBER DC 5W LED (1, 2, OR 3 PER FLASHER)
(PNS10-502463) PNS10-502463 5 EA $66.98 $334.90 $66.98 $334.90 $66.98 $334.90
48 SPEED LIMIT SIGN (24"X18") (PNS10-S1S5-1-MPH) PNS10-S1S5-1-MPH 5 EA $304.98 $1,524.90 $304.98] $1,524.90 $304.98| $1,524.90
49 CELL PHONE PROHIBIT (24"X18") (PNS10-S1S7-
1TK) PNS10-S1S7-1TK 5 EA $132.98 $664.90] $132.98 $664.90( $132.98 $664.90
50 |24"X30" EDGELIGHT 30MPH SIGN 5 EA $1,103.98| $5,519.90] $1,103.98] $5,519.90| $1,103.98] $5,519.90
51 |SPECIAL ORDER LINE - % DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR ITEMS NOT ITEMIZED IN THIS CONTRACT 2% No Bid No Bid
Total: $599,897.30 $709,061.30 $697,671.30
Evaluation
Ttem # Standard Criteria Con(s:(;ll:(ti:‘)tles (,1 111; l:‘fﬁc Cégﬁ?gﬁé;?égg MoboTrex, Inc
1|Delivery/Project Schedule - 20% 18.67 9.33 13.33
2|Compliance with Specifications- 40% 37.33 16.00 24.00
3|Probable Performance-10% 9.33 5.33 7.33
4/|Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 30% 30.00 25.38 25.80
Total Score: 95.33 56.04 70.46




