

Exhibit 2
RFP 8395 - Pricing Evaluation for Storm Pipe Cleaning and Inspection

Respondent's Business Name: Principal Place of Business (City and State):				Primary		Secondary			
				Pipe View America		Pro-Pipe, Inc		Ace Pipe Cleaning Inc	
				Azle, TX		Grand Prairie, TX		Kansas City, MO	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section A: Service Work - Hourly Rates								
2	Regular Working Hours (7:00 AM-4:00 PM / Monday- Friday): Storm Drain Cleaning*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	1000	HR	\$198.34	\$198,340.00	\$315.65	\$315,650.00	\$450.00	\$450,000.00
3	Regular Working Hours (7:00 AM-4:00 PM / Monday- Friday): Inspection Services*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	1000	HR	\$125.32	\$125,320.00	\$228.88	\$228,880.00	\$310.00	\$310,000.00
4	Section B: Service Work- Emergency Work Hours (30 Minute Response Time Required)								
5	Emergency Work Hours (30-Minute Response Time Required) Regular Working Hours (7:00 AM-4:00 PM / Monday- Friday): Storm Drain Cleaning*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	100	HR	\$238.34	\$23,834.00	\$349.93	\$34,993.00	No Bid	
6	Emergency Work Hours (30-Minute Response Time Required) Regular Working Hours (7:00 AM-4:00 PM / Monday- Friday): Inspection Services*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	100	HR	\$158.14	\$15,814.00	\$250.92	\$25,092.00	No Bid	
7	Emergency Work Hours (30-Minute Response Time Required) After Regular Working Hours: Storm Drain Cleaning*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	100	HR	\$251.39	\$25,139.00	\$445.64	\$44,564.00	No Bid	
8	Emergency Work Hours (30-Minute Response Time Required) After Regular Working Hours: Inspection Services*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	100	HR	\$181.19	\$18,119.00	\$322.11	\$32,211.00	No Bid	
9	Emergency Work Hours (30-Minute Response Time Required) Holidays: Storm Drain Cleaning*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	100	HR	\$268.34	\$26,834.00	\$541.34	\$54,134.00	No Bid	
10	Emergency Work Hours (30-Minute Response Time Required) Holidays: Inspection Services*Estimated Annual Quantity of Hours Needed*	100	HR	\$188.14	\$18,814.00	\$393.30	\$39,330.00	No Bid	
Total:				\$452,214.00		\$774,854.00		\$760,000.00	

Item #	Scoring Criteria	Pipe View America	Pro-Pipe, Inc	Ace Pipe Cleaning Inc
1	Project Schedule - 20%	14.67	13.33	6.67
2	Compliance with Specifications - 20%	13.33	13.33	4.00
3	Probable Performance - 20%	14.67	16.00	10.67
4	Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 40%	40.00	23.34	18.27
Total Score:		82.67	66.00	39.61