Exhibit 2

RFP 8836 - Pricing Evaluation for Electric Utility High Voltage Circuit Breakers

Respondent's Business Name:| Stuart C. Irby Company, LLC | Techline, Inc.
Principal Place of Business (City and State): Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX

Line # Description Mfgr | QTY| UOM Unit Unit
SECTION I - CIRCUIT BREAKERS - SIEMENS

2 |3000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, 40kA SIEMENS 2 EA $154,783.00 $158,040.00

3 |3000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, 63kA SIEMENS 10 |EA $233,355.00 $237,250.00

4 ]4000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, 63kA (12 BCTs -2000:5) SIEMENS 12 |EA $255,625.00 $261,005.00

5 ]4000A, 345kV Circuit Breaker, 63kA (12 BCTs -3000:5) SIEMENS 8 EA $661,740.00 $675,515.00

6 |4000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, 63kA (12 BCTs -3000:5) SIEMENS 1 EA $261,000.00 $261,005.00
SECTION II - CIRCUIT BREAKERS - MITSUBISHI

7 13000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, 40kA MITSUBISHI (2 EA No Bid No Bid

8 |3000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, S0kA MITSUBISHI |10 [(EA No Bid No Bid

9 ]4000A, 138kV Circuit Breaker, 50kA MITSUBISHI (12 [EA No Bid No Bid

10 [4000A, 345kV Circuit Breaker, 50kA MITSUBISHI (8 EA No Bid No Bid
SECTION III - 61850 OPTION

12 |Add (2) SEL-421 Merging Units with Wiring as shown in Spec. |12 |Per Breaker | No BidI No Bid
SECTION 1V - MAINTENANCE PARTS

14 |Y-Relay 1 EA $720.00 $685.00

15 [Close Coil 1 EA $610.00 $580.00

16 [Trip Coil 1 EA $610.00 $580.00

17 |Charging Motor 1 EA $1,330.00 $1,265.00

18 |Cabinet Heater 3 EA No Bid No Bid
SECTION V - RECOMMENDED SPARE PARTS

20 [Porcelain Bushings (145kV) E | $2,160.00] $2,050.00
Evaluation
Item # Scoring Criteria Stuart C. Irby Company, LLC | Techline, Inc.

1|Delivery/Project Schedule - 20% 12.00 12.00
2|Compliance with Specifications - 20% 12.00 12.00
3|Probable Performance - 20% 14.67 14.67
4|Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 40% 40.00 39.01

Total Score: 78.67 77.68




