
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 95 Gallon Trash Cart (Green) w/logo 2,106 EA $40.17 $84,598.02 $49.37 $103,973.22 $47.72 $100,498.32 $47.42 $99,866.52 $54.50 $114,777.00 $50.48 $106,310.88 $121.29 $255,436.74 $390.00 $821,340.00

2 95 Gallon Recycle Cart (Blue) w/logo 2,106 EA $40.17 $84,598.02 $49.37 $103,973.22 $47.72 $100,498.32 $47.42 $99,866.52 $54.50 $114,777.00 $50.48 $106,310.88 $114.79 $241,747.74 $375.00 $789,750.00

3 65 Gallon Trash Cart (Green) w/logo 1,296 EA $43.27 $56,077.92 $45.24 $58,631.04 $42.56 $55,157.76 $42.28 $54,794.88 $49.50 $64,152.00 $46.70 $60,523.20 $81.51 $105,636.96 $390.00 $505,440.00

4 65 Gallon Recycle Cart (Blue) w/logo 1,296 EA $43.27 $56,077.92 $45.24 $58,631.04 $42.56 $55,157.76 $42.28 $54,794.88 $49.50 $64,152.00 $46.70 $60,523.20 $79.56 $103,109.76 $390.00 $505,440.00

5 95 Gallon Yard Waste Cart (Brown) w/logo 2,106 EA $40.17 $84,598.02 $49.37 $103,973.22 $51.47 $108,395.82 $47.42 $99,866.52 $54.50 $114,777.00 $50.48 $106,310.88 $121.29 $255,436.74 $375.00 $789,750.00

6 35 Gallon Cart w/logo 1 EA $40.00 $40.00 $40.02 $40.02 $40.46 $40.46 $36.96 $36.96 $43.50 $43.50 $42.10 $42.10 $60.84 $60.84 $335.00 $335.00

7 65 Gallon Blue Recycling Lid w/Recycling Label 1 EA $19.80 $19.80 $16.00 $16.00 $17.64 $17.64 $14.42 $14.42 $16.00 $16.00 $19.00 $19.00 $13.00 $13.00 $365.00 $365.00

8 65 Gallon Green Trash Lid 1 EA $18.00 $18.00 $13.50 $13.50 $17.64 $17.64 $12.00 $12.00 $14.00 $14.00 $17.00 $17.00 $13.00 $13.00 $365.00 $365.00

9 95 Gallon Blue Recycling Lid w/Recycling Label 1 EA $19.80 $19.80 $16.70 $16.70 $19.49 $19.49 $14.42 $14.42 $17.00 $17.00 $19.00 $19.00 $13.00 $13.00 $325.00 $325.00

10 95 Gallon Green Trash Lid 1 EA $18.00 $18.00 $14.20 $14.20 $19.49 $19.49 $12.00 $12.00 $15.00 $15.00 $17.00 $17.00 $13.00 $13.00 $425.00 $425.00

11 95 Gallon Brown Yard Waste Lid w/Ventilation 1 EA $23.00 $23.00 $19.20 $19.20 $23.24 $23.24 $13.75 $13.75 No Bid $425.00 $17.00 $17.00 $13.00 $13.00 $425.00 $425.00

12 Recycling In-mold Label 1 EA $1.80 $1.80 $2.50 $2.50 $2.15 $2.15 $2.42 $2.42 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $6.50 $6.50 $480.00 $480.00

13 Gravity Lock 1 EA $36.00 $36.00 $5.00 $5.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.48 $40.48 $5.00 $5.00 $23.00 $23.00 $5.98 $5.98 $380.00 $380.00

14 10-inch Plastic Wheel 1 EA $12.00 $12.00 $5.50 $5.50 $4.50 $4.50 $5.00 $5.00 $4.00 $4.00 $5.00 $5.00 $7.15 $7.15 $85.00 $85.00

15 12-inch Plastic Wheel 1 EA $12.00 $12.00 $6.00 $6.00 No Bid $105.00 $5.50 $5.50 No Bid $105.00 $6.00 $6.00 $8.45 $8.45 $105.00 $105.00

16 RFID Handheld Reader 1 EA $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 No Bid $4,500.00 2750 $2,750.00 $156.00 $156.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00
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Exhibit 2

RFP 8894 - Pricing Evaluation for Trash and Recycle Carts

Respondent's Business Name:

Principal Place of Business (City and State):

Scoring Criteria

$370,650.30 $431,320.36 $421,247.59 $410,546.27Total:

Evaluation

Total Score:

Delivery/Project Schedule - 15%

Compliance with Specifications - 20%

Probable Performance - 30%

Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 35%

89.00

Rehrig Pacific Company
Cascade Engineering, 

Inc.
Toter, LLC

Schaefer Plastics North 

America, LLC

20.00

30.08

76.75

20.00

Rehrig Pacific Company

12.00

16.00

26.00

35.00

Dallas, TX Grand Rapids, MI

14.67

Toter, LLC

12.00

13.33

Sierra Container Group, 

LLC

Otto Environmental 

Systems
TOCA LLC

Greenville Enterprises 

LLC

Cascade Engineering, 

Inc.

12.00

Sierra Container Group, 

LLC

$477,781.50 $442,896.14 $961,677.86 $3,418,810.00

Statesville, NC Charlotte, NC Ocala, FL Charlotte, NC Keller, TX Southlake, TX

30.80

76.13

Schaefer Plastics North 

America, LLC

10.00

12.00

18.00

31.60

71.60

10.00

12.00

18.00

27.15

67.15 30.4666.96

TOCA LLC

12.00

8.00

10.00

13.49

43.49

Otto Environmental 

Systems

11.00

10.67

16.00

29.29

Greenville Enterprises 

LLC

10.00

6.67

10.00

3.79


