Exhibit 2
RFP 8683- Pricing Evaluation for Fuel Island Repair and Maintenance

Respondent's Business Name:

Stovall Commercial
Contractors, L.L.C.

Industrial Contamination
Extraction Service

Principal Place of Business (City and State): Kennedale, TX Temple, TX
Line # Description [QTY| uOM Unit Unit
1|SECTION A - MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR RATES
2|FIELD SERVICE RATE 1[ hourly $85.00 $85.00
3|TRAVEL/MILEAGE RATE FEE 1| Per Mile $1.00 $1.00
4|AFTER HOURS/WEEKENDS/HOLIDAY FIELD SERVICE RATE 1{ Hourly $95.00 No Bid
5|QUARTERLY INSPECTION PREVENTION MAINTENANCE SERVICE 1 EA $400.00 $900.00
6/ANNUAL VAPOR RECOVERY SYSTEM TESTING 1 EA $450.00 No Bid
7|ANNUAL LINE TIGHTNESS TESTING 1 EA $200.00 No Bid
8|ANNUAL SUMP TESTING 1 EA $350.00 No Bid
9|ANNUAL VAPOR RECOVERY SYSTEM TESTING - ARID 1 EA $450.00 No Bid
10|SECTION B - VALUE ADDED OR ADDITIONAL SERVICES
11|ASSISTANCE WITH TCEQ INSPECTIONS (included) | 1] EA $85.00 No Bid
12|Replacement parts 10% 30%
13|Rate for water removal/disposal from tanks during quarterly inspections. $150.00 $0.00
Evaluation
I Stovall Commercial |Industrial Contamination
Item # Standard Criteria Contractors, L.L.C. Extraction Service
1[Delivery/Project Schedule - 10% 6.00 6.67
2[Compliance with Specifications - 20% 14.67 12.00
3|Probable Performance - 30% 22.00 12.00
4|Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 40% 40.00 35.81
Total Score: 82.67 66.48




