

Exhibit 2
IFB 8406 - Bid Tabulation for Traffic Signal Hardware, Cabinets, and Electronics

Respondent's Business Name: Principal Place of Business (City and State):				Mobotrex, Inc. Davenport, IA		Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. Arlington, TX		Texas Highway Products Round Rock, TX		Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. Arlington, TX	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	SECTION A: PELCO MOUNTING HARDWARE										
2	PELCO 3-SECTION ASTROBRAC ASSEMBLY WITH 144 INCH CABLE AND GUSSETED TUBE, AS-0125-3-144	1	EA	\$198.00	\$198.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$195.00	\$195.00	\$224.73	\$224.73
3	PELCO 4-SECTION ASTROBRAC ASSEMBLY WITH 144 INCH CABLE AND GUSSETED TUBE, AS-0125-4-144	1	EA	\$220.00	\$220.00	\$222.00	\$222.00	\$215.00	\$215.00	\$249.40	\$249.40
4	PELCO 5-SECTION ASTROBRAC ASSEMBLY WITH 144 INCH CABLE AND GUSSETED TUBE, AS-0125-5-144	1	EA	\$240.00	\$240.00	\$236.00	\$236.00	\$235.00	\$235.00	\$233.45	\$233.45
5	PELCO 5-SECTION ASTROBRAC CLUSTER ASSEMBLY WITH 144 INCH CABLE AND GUSSETED TUBE, AS-0138-2-144	1	EA	\$320.00	\$320.00	\$325.00	\$325.00	\$320.00	\$320.00	\$365.40	\$365.40
6	ASTRO-BRAC STELLAR ASSY, 1-WAY 3-SEC, 120" GALV CABLE AS-0125-3-120	1	EA	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$195.00	\$195.00	\$190.00	\$190.00	\$218.95	\$218.95
7	ASTRO-BRAC STELLAR ASSY, 1-WAY 4-SEC, 120" GALV CABLE AS-0125-4-120	1	EA	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$205.00	\$205.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$229.10	\$229.10
8	ASTRO-BRAC STELLAR ASSY, 1-WAY 5-SEC, 120" GALV CABLE AS-0125-5-120	1	EA	\$210.00	\$210.00	\$218.00	\$218.00	\$215.00	\$215.00	\$229.10	\$229.10
9	PELCO 3-SECTION HORIZONTAL SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY WITH STANDARD TUBE, AB-0127-3	1	EA	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$142.00	\$142.00	\$138.00	\$138.00	\$159.50	\$159.50
10	PELCO 4-SECTION HORIZONTAL SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY WITH STANDARD TUBE, AB-0127-4	1	EA	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$151.00	\$151.00	\$148.00	\$148.00	\$169.65	\$169.65
11	PELCO 5-SECTION HORIZONTAL SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY WITH STANDARD TUBE, AB-0127-5	1	EA	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$155.00	\$155.00	\$179.80	\$179.80
12	PELCO 3-SECTION HORIZONTAL SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY FOR TETHER WIRE, SP-3058-TX-3-ALO	1	EA	\$218.00	\$218.00	\$283.00	\$283.00	\$310.00	\$310.00	\$317.55	\$317.55
13	PELCO 4-SECTION HORIZONTAL SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY FOR TETHER WIRE, SP-3058-TX-4-ALO	1	EA	\$228.00	\$228.00	\$297.00	\$297.00	\$315.00	\$315.00	\$333.50	\$333.50
14	PELCO 5-SECTION HORIZONTAL SPAN WIRE ASSEMBLY FOR TETHER WIRE, SP-3058-TX-5-ALO	1	EA	\$238.00	\$238.00	\$315.00	\$315.00	\$320.00	\$320.00	\$350.90	\$350.90
15	PELCO 5-SECTION SPAN WIRE CLUSTER HARDWARE, 1 EA: SE-0338, SE-0371-M2, SE-5121, 2 EA: SE-0474-M2, FS-3218-SS	1	EA	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$140.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$149.33	\$149.33
16	PELCO SPAN WIRE SIGN HARDWARE, 1 EA: SE-0338, SE-5037, AND SE-5051-72	1	EA	\$75.00	\$75.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$114.55	\$114.55
17	PELCO PEDESTAL POLE HARDWARE, 1 EA: PB-0543, PB-5335, PB-5306, PB-5325, PB-5401, FS-2039-SS, AND PB-5100-16	1	EA	\$828.00	\$828.00	\$805.00	\$805.00	\$860.00	\$860.00	\$1,026.00	\$1,026.00
18	PELCO ASTROBRAC W/ 144 INCH CABLE, AS-3009-144	1	EA	\$120.00	\$120.00	\$118.00	\$118.00	\$115.00	\$115.00	\$131.95	\$131.95
19	PELCO MINI ASTROBRAC CABLE MOUNT, AB-0160-45	1	EA	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$51.00	\$51.00	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$56.55	\$56.55
20	PELCO MINI ASTROBRAC CABLE MOUNT, AB-0163-45	1	EA	\$48.00	\$48.00	\$47.00	\$47.00	\$46.00	\$46.00	\$52.55	\$52.55
21	PELCO PED PUSH BUTTON STATION, BLACK, SE-2023-08-P34	1	EA	\$88.00	\$88.00	\$89.00	\$89.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$100.05	\$100.05
22	PELCO PED SIGN LEFT, SF-1030-05, FOR STATION SE-2023-08	1	EA	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	No Bid	\$25.00
23	PELCO PED SIGN RIGHT, SF-1031-05, FOR STATION SE-2023-08	1	EA	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	No Bid	\$25.00
24	PELCO PED SIGN, SF-1020-05, FOR STATION SE-2023-08	1	EA	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	\$23.00	No Bid	\$25.00
25	PELCO PED PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY, BLACK, SE-2009-08-P34	1	EA	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$43.00	\$43.00	\$45.00	\$45.00	\$53.65	\$53.65
26	PELCO PED PUSH BUTTON SWITCH, SE-0211	1	EA	\$65.00	\$65.00	No Bid	\$65.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	No Bid	\$65.00
27	PELCO TETHER ASSEMBLY, SE-5121	1	EA	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$53.75	\$53.75
28	PELCO U-BOLT WITH MUFFLER CLAMP , WB-5275	1	EA	\$12.00	\$12.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$7.25	\$7.25
29	PELCO PINS, 1 EA: FS-6003-GLV AND FS-6100-SS	1	EA	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$0.50	\$0.50	\$5.36	\$5.36
30	PELCO ITC HANDHOLE COVER ASSEMBLY, AP-1087	1	EA	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$66.00	\$66.00	\$71.05	\$71.05
31	PELCO SPAN WIRE ADAPTER, SE-0371-M2	1	EA	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$21.73	\$21.73
32	PELCO ILSN MOUNTS, 1 EA: AB-0160-45, SE-0371-M2, SE-0611-M2, SE-4031-M2, SE-5048-SS	1	EA	\$115.00	\$115.00	\$106.00	\$106.00	\$115.00	\$115.00	\$130.47	\$130.47
33	PELCO HORIZONTAL SLIP TEE, SE-0474-M1	1	EA	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$18.00	\$18.00	\$16.10	\$16.10	\$20.30	\$20.30
34	PELCO SERRATED ELL, SE-0457-M1	1	EA	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$22.00	\$22.00	\$16.20	\$16.20	\$17.40	\$17.40

Exhibit 2

IFB 8406 - Bid Tabulation for Traffic Signal Hardware, Cabinets, and Electronics

Respondent's Business Name: Principal Place of Business (City and State):				Mobotrex, Inc.		Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.		Texas Highway Products		Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.	
				Davenport, IA		Arlington, TX		Round Rock, TX		Arlington, TX	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
35	PELCO NIPPLE, 1-1/2" NPS X 12", SE-0436-12	1	EA	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$15.50	\$15.50	\$15.95	\$15.95
36	PELCO NIPPLE, 1-1/2" NPS X 74", SE-0436-74	1	EA	\$32.00	\$32.00	\$68.00	\$68.00	\$70.00	\$70.00	\$75.40	\$75.40
37	PELCO ANCHOR NUT SETS, 4 EA: FS-1010-GLV, FS-4911-GLV	1	EA	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$58.00	\$58.00	No Bid	\$58.00	\$23.20	\$23.20
38	WIND DAMPNER SIGN BLANK 18"X60", SF-6014-60-PNC	1	EA	\$202.00	\$202.00	\$181.00	\$181.00	No Bid	\$203.00	\$203.00	\$203.00
39	WIND DAMPNER MOUNTING TUBE, 12" EXTENTION, AB-0365-12-54-PNC	1	EA	\$88.00	\$88.00	\$43.00	\$43.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	No Bid	\$88.00
40	BASE ASSEMBLY, SQUARE W/PLASTIC DOOR, ALUMINUM, PB-5335-PNC	1	EA	\$180.00	\$180.00	\$199.00	\$199.00	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$203.00	\$203.00
41	Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above.	1	%	No Bid		No Bid		10.0%		No Bid	
SECTION A TOTAL:				\$5,133.00		\$5,323.00		\$5,388.30		\$6,021.52	
42	SECTION B: CABINET ELECTRONICS 1										
43	PDC NEMA CABINET FLASHERS, MODEL 200 LOADSWITCH	1	EA	No Bid	\$34.80	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$29.00	\$29.00	\$34.80	\$34.80
44	PDC NEMA CABINET FLASHERS, MODEL 204, SSF-87	1	EA	No Bid	\$34.80	\$38.00	\$38.00	\$29.00	\$29.00	\$34.80	\$34.80
45	PDC NEMA CABINET LOADSWITCHES, SSS-87I/O	1	EA	No Bid	\$51.00	\$42.00	\$42.00	\$29.00	\$29.00	\$51.00	\$51.00
46	EDI MMU2-16LEip MONITOR WITH ETHERNET PORT (EDI MMU-16LEIP)	1	EA	No Bid	\$1,325.30	\$1,275.00	\$1,275.00	\$1,165.00	\$1,165.00	\$1,325.30	\$1,325.30
47	ECONOLITE COBALT CONTROLLER (21100110000)	1	EA	No Bid	\$4,410.00	\$4,410.00	\$4,410.00	No Bid	\$4,410.00	No Bid	\$4,410.00
48	FXM-HP1100, 120V I/O W/TB I/O (0170024-001)	1	EA	No Bid	\$1,358.00	\$1,358.00	\$1,358.00	No Bid	\$1,358.00	No Bid	\$1,358.00
49	240XTV BATTERY, 12VDC, 112Ah (1810229)	1	EA	No Bid	\$290.00	\$290.00	\$290.00	No Bid	\$290.00	No Bid	\$290.00
50	Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above.	1	%	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
51	SECTION C: CABINETS 1										
52	UPS BATTERY BACKUP SYSTEM C/O	1	EA	No Bid	\$6,200.00	\$6,200.00	\$6,200.00	No Bid	\$6,200.00	No Bid	\$6,200.00
53	HENKE CABINET ASSEMBLY (TS1 P44 / DENTON SPEC)	1	EA	No Bid	\$15,885.00	\$15,885.00	\$15,885.00	No Bid	\$15,885.00	No Bid	\$15,885.00
54	PTSI P44 COB C/O	1	EA	No Bid	\$15,885.00	\$15,885.00	\$15,885.00	No Bid	\$15,885.00	No Bid	\$15,885.00
55	Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above.	1	%	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
56	SECTION D: APPLIED INFORMATION ELECTRONICS 1										
57	Applied Information, AI-500-065-Preempt/Priority VPU (Includes In Vehicle Device, Glance Software w/Configuration, 10 Year Connectivity Service, No Video)	1	EA	No Bid	\$6,300.00	\$6,300.00	\$6,300.00	No Bid	\$6,300.00	No Bid	\$6,300.00
58	Applied Information, AI-500-085-02-Preempt/Priority FMU2 (Includes In Cabinet Device, Glance Software w/Configuration, 10 Year Connectivity Service, No Video)	1	EA	No Bid	\$6,300.00	\$6,300.00	\$6,300.00	No Bid	\$6,300.00	No Bid	\$6,300.00
59	AI-500-070 Applied Information, School Timer Switch & Cell (Includes Device, Glance Software w/Configuration, & 10-Year Connectivity Plan)	1	EA	No Bid	\$3,300.00	\$3,300.00	\$3,300.00	No Bid	\$3,300.00	No Bid	\$3,300.00
60	Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above.	1	%	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
61	SECTION E: PTX CAMERA & ACCESSORIES										
62	PTZ CAMERA KIT, 1080P W/Attachments	10	EA	\$5,788.00	\$57,880.00	\$5,600.00	\$56,000.00	No Bid	\$57,880.00	No Bid	\$57,880.00
63	Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above.	1	%	5.0%		No Bid		10.0%		No Bid	
Total:				\$119,253.90		\$117,308.00		\$119,060.00		\$119,253.90	