Exhibit 2
RFP 8457 - Pricing Evaluation for Supply of Equipment Trailers

Primary Secondary
. dil;hlg:)l: t;ng;s;l;sr;ifs Bragg Trailers LLC | Phoenix Contracting| Kirby-Smith Machinery
Respondent's Business Name:
Principal Place of Business (City and State): Corinth, TX Denton, TX Ruskin, FL Oklahoma City, OK
Line # Description |UOM Unit Unit Unit Unit
Section A - Bumper Pull
1 |Utility Trailer 60" x 14' GVRW 2,995# EA $2,483.08 $2,640.00 $4,500.00 NO BID
2 |Tandem Axle Utility Trailer 77" x 16ft 6,000 GVRW EA $3,274.28 $4,180.00 $6,000.00 NO BID
3 |6 x 14 Enclosed Trailer EA $7,635.08 NO BID $9,975.00 NO BID
4 8.5 x 24 x 84 Enclosed Trailer EA $11,683.08 NO BID $15,000.00 NO BID
5 |24k Ib GVWR Bumper Pull Dump Trailer EA NO BID $23,980.00 $26,000.00 NO BID
6 |27k Ib GVWR Bumper Pull Dump Trailer EA NO BID $24,970.00 $28,000.00 NO BID
7 |30k Ib GVWR Bumper Pull Dump Trailer EA NO BID $27,060.00 $32,000.00 NO BID
8 |22k Ib GVWR Bumper Pull Dump Deck Over Trailer EA NO BID $16,610.00 $26,000.00 NO BID
9 |26k Ib GVWR Bumper Pull Dump Deck Over Trailer EA NO BID $19,690.00 $28,000.00 NO BID
Section B - Gooseneck
10 [45ft 24k Ib GVWR Flatbed Equipment Gooseneck Trailer single wheel EA $23,131.55 NO BID $21,000.00 $35,687.00
11 |45ft 30k Ib GVWR Flatbed Equipment Gooseneck Trailer duel wheel EA $29,021.55 NO BID $27,000.00 $35,687.00
12 |30ft 36k Ib GVWR Flatbed Equipment Gooseneck Trailer duek wheel EA $29,639.05 NO BID $29,000.00 $35,687.00
13 |35ft 36k Ib GVWR Flatbed Equipment Gooseneck Trailer duek wheel EA $30,684.05 NO BID $32,000.00 $35,687.00
14 [45ft 36k Ib GVWR Flatbed Equipment Gooseneck Trailer duek wheel EA NO BID NO BID $35,000.00 $35,687.00
15 |22k Ib GVWR Gooseneck Dump Deck Over Trailer EA $23,891.55 $25,080.00 $29,000.00 NO BID
16 |26k Ib GVWR Gooseneck Dump Deck Over Trailer EA $26,361.55 $26,070.00 $31,000.00 NO BID
17 |30k Ib GVWR Gooseneck Dump Deck Over Trailer EA $30,836.05 $28,160.00 $33,000.00 NO BID
18 [35ft 14k Ib GVWR Gooseneck Lowboy Equipment Trailer With Rails EA $11,779.05 NO BID $18,000.00 NO BID
19 [30ft 22k Ib GVWR Gooseneck Deck Over Flatbed Power Tilt Trailer EA $25,554.05 $22,550.00 $25,000.00 $45,782.00
20 [35ft 30k Ib GVWR Gooseneck Deck Over Flatbed Power Tilt Trailer EA NO BID $24,200.00 $29,000.00 $45,782.00
Section C - Utility/Enclosed
21 |Utility Trailer 60" x 14' GVRW 2,995# EA $2,537.06 $2,640.00 $4,500.00 NO BID
22 |Single Axle ATV Trailer 83" x 14' 2,995# GVRW EA $2,819.06 $2,860.00 $5,500.00 NO BID
23 |Tandem Axle Utility Trailer 77" x 16ft 6,000 GVRW EA $3,345.46 $4,180.00 $6,000.00 NO BID
24 |6 x 12 Enclosed Trailer EA $6,579.06 NO BID $9,995.00 NO BID
25 |6 x 14 Enclosed Trailer EA $7,801.06 NO BID $10,550.00 NO BID
26 |8.5x 24 x 84 Enclosed Trailer EA $11,937.06 NO BID $15,000.00 NO BID
Evaluation
Item # Scoring Criteria dl:):hlg::t{lng;s;l;sr;{;i Bragg Trailers LLC | Phoenix Contracting | Kirby-Smith Machinery
1 [Delivery/Product Lead Time - 10% 7.33 4.00 5.33 4.00
2 |Compliance with Specifications - 30% 20.00 22.00 18.00 14.00
3 |Probable Performance - 10% 8.00 5.33 2.67 4.67
4  |Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 50% 47.68 50.00 45.58 40.18
Total Score: 83.01 81.33 71.58 62.85




