
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Drug sample collection and lab testing for original sample, including random selection processes (DOT) 1 EA no bid $65.00 $65.00 $65.00

2 Drug sample collection and lab testing for original sample, NOT including random selection processes (DOT) 1 EA $75.00 $75.00 $50.00 $50.00

3 Medical Review Officer (MRO) services for drug testing (DOT) 1 EA Included $15.00 $15.00

4 Testing of split specimen (DOT) 1 EA $150.00 $150.00 $300.00 $300.00

5 Drug and alcohol sample collection after normal business hours (DOT) 1 EA no bid $150.00 $150.00 $150.00

6 On site collections at a City building (DOT) 1 EA no bid $85.00 $85.00 $85.00

7 Drug sample collection and lab testing for original sample, including random selection processes (NON-DOT) 1 EA no bid $50.00 $50.00 $50.00

8 Drug sample collection and lab testing for original sample, NOT including random selection processes (NON-DOT) 1 EA $60.00 $60.00 $40.00 $40.00

9 Medical Review Officer (MRO) services for drug testing (NON-DOT) 1 EA Included N/A

10 Testing of split specimen (NON-DOT) 1 EA $150.00 $150.00 $200.00 $200.00

11 Drug and alcohol sample collection after normal business hours (NON-DOT) 1 EA no bid $120.00 $120.00 $120.00

12 On site collections at a City building (NON-DOT) 1 EA $70.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00

Item #

1

2

3 Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 50%

Total Score:

Scoring Criteria

50.00 42.58

98.33 65.91

11.67

Evaluation

Primary Health 

Physicians, PLLC 

NextGen Dot 

Services

25.00

23.33 11.66

Compliance with specifications, quality, reliability, characteristics to meet stated or implied need - 25%

Indicators of Probable Performance under contract - 25%

Exhibit 2

RFP 8792 - Pricing Evaluation for Drug, Alcohol, and Physicals Testing

Total: $975.00 $1,145.00

Respondent's Business Name:

Principal Place of Business (City and State):

Primary Health 

Physicians, PLLC 

NextGen Dot 

Services

I. Drug & Alcohol Testing

Lewisville, TX Houston, TX


