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1

2 Satellite Clock - Mfgr SEL 240700013

2.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,050.16 $2,135.60 $2,250.00 $2,436.71 $2,343.04 $2,837.65

2.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,030.58 $2,115.20 $2,250.00 $2,342.99 $2,343.04 $2,810.59

2.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,978.52 $2,061.00 $2,250.00 $2,249.27 $2,343.04 $2,738.82

2.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

3 Line Current Differential 0311L13DA4254X2XX

3.1 1-4 units 1 EA $9,096.75 $9,475.80 $9,985.00 $10,631.50 $10,365.43 $12,590.59

3.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $8,869.33 $9,238.90 $9,985.00 $10,222.60 $10,365.43 $12,276.47

3.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $8,641.91 $9,002.00 $9,985.00 $9,813.70 $10,365.43 $11,961.18

3.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

4 Line Current Differential 0311L13DA4254X5XX

4.1 1-4 units 1 EA $9,566.60 $9,965.20 $10,505.00 $11,192.92 $10,933.26 $13,241.18

4.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $9,327.44 $9,716.10 $10,505.00 $10,762.43 $10,933.26 $12,909.41

4.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $9,088.27 $9,466.90 $10,505.00 $10,331.93 $10,933.26 $12,578.82

4.4 Delivery 1 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

5 Line Current Differential 0311L13DD4254X2XX

5.1 1-4 units 1 EA $9,768.64 $10,175.70 $10,725.00 $11,868.06 $11,164.16 $13,521.18

5.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $9,768.64 $10,175.70 $10,725.00 $11,411.60 $11,164.16 $13,521.18

5.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $9,636.46 $10,038.00 $10,725.00 $10,955.14 $11,164.16 $13,337.65

5.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

6 Line Current Differential 0311L13DD4254X5XX

6.1 1-4 units 1 EA $10,613.49 $11,055.70 $11,650.00 $12,417.78 $12,129.70 $14,689.41

6.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $10,348.15 $10,779.30 $11,650.00 $11,940.18 $12,129.70 $14,322.35

6.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $10,082.82 $10,502.90 $11,650.00 $11,462.57 $12,129.70 $13,955.29

6.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

7 Breaker Protection 0351S6X3D4E5421

7.1 1-4 units 1 EA $4,580.15 $4,771.00 $5,030.00 $5,358.78 $5,234.46 $6,338.82

7.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $4,465.65 $4,651.70 $5,030.00 $5,152.68 $5,234.46 $6,181.18

7.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $4,351.14 $4,532.40 $5,030.00 $4,946.57 $5,234.46 $6,022.35

7.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

8 Breaker Protection 0351S6X3D4F5422

8.1 1-4 units 1 EA $5,128.53 $5,342.20 $5,630.00 $6,000.38 $5,861.18 $7,098.82

8.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $5,000.32 $5,208.70 $5,630.00 $5,769.60 $5,861.18 $6,921.18

8.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $4,872.10 $5,075.10 $5,630.00 $5,538.82 $5,861.18 $6,743.53

8.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

9 Breaker Protection 0351S7X3D4E5421

9.1 1-4 units 1 EA $5,440.10 $5,666.80 $5,975.00 $6,364.92 $6,217.26 $7,529.41

9.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $5,304.10 $5,525.10 $5,975.00 $6,120.11 $6,217.26 $7,341.18

9.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $5,168.10 $5,383.40 $5,975.00 $5,875.31 $6,217.26 $7,152.94

9.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

10 Breaker Protection 0351S7X3D4F5422

10.1 1-4 units 1 EA $5,988.48 $6,238.00 $6,575.00 $7,006.52 $6,843.98 $8,288.24
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10.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $5,838.77 $6,082.10 $6,575.00 $6,737.04 $6,843.98 $8,081.18

10.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $5,689.06 $5,926.10 $6,575.00 $6,467.56 $6,843.98 $7,874.12

10.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

11 Current Differential 0387604X53XX4XX

11.1 1-4 units 1 EA $7,378.10 $7,685.50 $8,100.00 $8,632.38 $8,432.11 $10,211.76

11.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $7,193.65 $7,493.40 $8,100.00 $8,300.36 $8,432.11 $9,956.47

11.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $7,009.20 $7,301.30 $8,100.00 $7,968.35 $8,432.11 $9,701.18

11.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

12 Line Current Differential 0411L0X6X5B6DDX3474XXXX

12.1 1-4 units 1 EA $15,432.93 $16,076.00 $16,945.00 $18,056.53 $17,637.63 $21,360.00

12.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $15,047.11 $15,674.10 $16,945.00 $17,362.05 $17,637.63 $20,825.88

12.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $14,661.28 $15,272.20 $16,945.00 $16,667.57 $17,637.63 $20,292.94

12.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

13 Line Current Differential 0411L0X6X5B6DDX357424XX

13.1 1-4 units 1 EA $16,149.55 $16,822.40 $17,730.00 $18,894.98 $18,456.63 $22,352.94

13.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $15,745.81 $16,401.90 $17,730.00 $18,168.25 $18,456.63 $21,792.94

13.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $15,342.07 $15,981.30 $17,730.00 $17,441.52 $18,456.63 $21,235.29

13.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

14 Line Current Differential 0411L0X6X5C7DDX357424XX

14.1 1-4 units 1 EA $16,853.72 $17,556.00 $18,505.00 $19,718.86 $19,261.39 $23,327.05

14.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $16,432.38 $17,117.10 $18,505.00 $18,960.44 $19,261.39 $22,743.53

14.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $16,011.03 $16,678.20 $18,505.00 $18,202.02 $19,261.39 $22,161.18

14.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

15 Bus Differential and Breaker Failure 0487B1X6X52XB1XE37EPXXX

15.1 1-4 units 1 EA $12,571.44 $13,095.30 $13,805.00 $14,708.59 $14,367.36 $17,397.65

15.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $12,257.15 $12,767.90 $13,805.00 $14,142.88 $14,367.36 $16,964.70

15.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $11,942.87 $12,440.50 $13,805.00 $13,577.16 $14,367.36 $16,529.41

15.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

16 Bus Differential and Breaker Failure 0487B1X6X52XC3XE38PPXXX

16.1 1-4 units 1 EA $13,632.04 $14,200.00 $14,965.00 $15,949.49 $15,579.47 $18,868.24

16.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $13,291.24 $13,845.00 $14,965.00 $15,336.05 $15,579.47 $18,396.47

16.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $12,950.44 $13,490.00 $14,965.00 $14,722.61 $15,579.47 $17,924.71

16.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

17 Transformer Protection 0487E3X611XXB1X435XXXXX

17.1 1-4 units 1 EA $10,335.57 $10,766.20 $11,350.00 $12,092.61 $11,812.08 $14,304.71

17.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $10,077.18 $10,497.10 $11,350.00 $11,627.51 $11,812.08 $13,948.24

17.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $9,818.79 $10,227.90 $11,350.00 $11,162.41 $11,812.08 $13,590.59

17.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

18 Transformer Protection 0487E3X611XXB1X43624XXX

18.1 1-4 units 1 EA $11,052.19 $11,512.70 $12,135.00 $12,931.06 $12,631.07 $15,297.65

18.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $10,775.89 $11,224.90 $12,135.00 $12,433.71 $12,631.07 $14,915.29

18.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $10,499.58 $10,937.10 $12,135.00 $11,936.36 $12,631.07 $14,531.76

18.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3
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19 Transformer Protection 0487E3X611XXC3X4374474X

19.1 1-4 units 1 EA $13,102.36 $13,648.30 $14,385.00 $15,329.76 $14,974.13 $18,135.29

19.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $12,774.80 $13,307.10 $14,385.00 $14,740.15 $14,974.13 $17,681.78

19.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $12,447.24 $12,965.90 $14,385.00 $14,150.54 $14,974.13 $17,228.24

19.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

20 Overcurrent Relay 050120325613XB

20.1 1-4 units 1 EA $1,567.85 $1,633.20 $1,720.00 $1,834.39 $1,791.83 $2,169.41

20.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $1,528.65 $1,592.30 $1,720.00 $1,763.84 $1,791.83 $2,115.29

20.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,489.46 $1,551.50 $1,720.00 $1,693.28 $1,791.83 $2,061.18

20.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

21 Overcurrent/Reclosing Relay 0551C0BX533X

21.1 1-4 units 1 EA $1,538.38 $1,602.50 $1,690.00 $1,855.57 $1,758.15 $2,129.41

21.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $1,538.38 $1,602.50 $1,690.00 $1,784.20 $1,758.15 $2,129.41

21.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,506.66 $1,569.40 $1,690.00 $1,712.83 $1,758.15 $2,085.88

21.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

22 Differential Relay 0587Z0X325312XX

22.1 1-4 units 1 EA $5,400.35 $5,625.40 $5,930.00 $6,561.78 $6,171.83 $7,474.12

22.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $5,400.35 $5,625.40 $5,930.00 $6,309.40 $6,171.83 $7,474.12

22.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $5,327.93 $5,549.90 $5,930.00 $6,057.02 $6,171.83 $7,374.12

22.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

23 EPS Meter 0735VX20944CGXA4XX16101XX

23.1 1-4 units 1 EA $4,997.06 $5,205.30 $5,485.00 $5,846.56 $5,710.93 $6,916.47

23.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $4,872.13 $5,075.10 $5,485.00 $5,621.69 $5,710.93 $6,743.53

23.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $4,747.21 $4,945.00 $5,485.00 $5,396.82 $5,710.93 $6,570.59

23.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

24 EPS Meter 0735VX20944FGXA4XX16201XX

24.1 1-4 units 1 EA $5,508.65 $5,738.20 $6,045.00 $6,445.13 $6,295.60 $7,624.71

24.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $5,370.93 $5,594.70 $6,045.00 $6,197.24 $6,295.60 $7,434.12

24.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $5,233.22 $5,451.30 $6,045.00 $5,949.35 $6,295.60 $7,243.53

24.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

25 Transformer Protection Relay 07873EE1A2A3A7685A830

25.1 1-4 units 1 EA $8,884.88 $9,255.10 $9,755.00 $10,395.31 $10,154.15 $12,297.65

25.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $8,662.76 $9,023.70 $9,755.00 $9,995.49 $10,154.15 $11,989.41

25.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $8,440.64 $8,792.30 $9,755.00 $9,595.67 $10,154.15 $11,682.35

25.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

26 Logic Processor 2100XX4443

26.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,701.51 $3,855.70 $4,065.00 $4,330.77 $4,230.30 $5,123.53

26.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,608.97 $3,759.30 $4,065.00 $4,164.20 $4,230.30 $4,995.29

26.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,516.43 $3,662.90 $4,065.00 $3,997.63 $4,230.30 $4,867.05

26.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

27 Programmable Automation Controller 241101AA0BA1A0X0130

27.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,272.64 $2,367.30 $2,495.00 $2,658.99 $2,597.30 $3,145.88

27.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,215.82 $2,308.10 $2,495.00 $2,556.73 $2,597.30 $3,067.06
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27.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $2,159.01 $2,249.00 $2,495.00 $2,454.46 $2,597.30 $2,988.24

27.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

28 Programmable Automation Controller 241101AA0BA1A0X0840

28.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,123.23 $3,253.40 $3,430.00 $3,654.18 $3,569.41 $4,322.35

28.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,045.15 $3,172.00 $3,430.00 $3,513.64 $3,569.41 $4,215.29

28.3 20+ Units 1 EA $2,967.07 $3,090.70 $3,430.00 $3,373.09 $3,569.41 $4,107.06

28.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

29 Transformer Monitor 241421ABACACA850130

29.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,899.53 $3,020.30 $3,180.00 $3,392.45 $3,313.75 $4,012.94

29.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,827.04 $2,944.80 $3,180.00 $3,261.98 $3,313.75 $3,912.94

29.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $2,754.55 $2,869.30 $3,180.00 $3,131.50 $3,313.75 $3,812.94

29.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

30 Transformer Monitor 241421ABACACA850840

30.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,750.12 $3,906.40 $4,115.00 $4,387.64 $4,285.85 $5,190.59

30.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,656.37 $3,808.70 $4,115.00 $4,218.89 $4,285.85 $5,061.18

30.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,562.61 $3,711.10 $4,115.00 $4,050.13 $4,285.85 $4,930.59

30.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

31 DPAC 24402311A1A11630

31.1 1-4 units 1 EA $1,308.62 $1,363.10 $1,435.00 $1,531.09 $1,495.57 $1,811.76

31.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $1,275.90 $1,329.10 $1,435.00 $1,472.20 $1,495.57 $1,765.88

31.3 20+ Units 1 EA $1,243.19 $1,295.00 $1,435.00 $1,413.31 $1,495.57 $1,721.18

31.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

32 DPAC 24402311A1A11840

32.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,065.13 $2,151.20 $2,265.00 $2,416.21 $2,360.15 $2,858.82

32.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,013.50 $2,097.40 $2,265.00 $2,323.28 $2,360.15 $2,787.06

32.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,961.87 $2,043.60 $2,265.00 $2,230.34 $2,360.15 $2,715.29

32.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

33 DPAC 24402312A1A11630

33.1 1-4 units 1 EA $1,308.62 $1,363.10 $1,435.00 $1,531.09 $1,495.57 $1,811.76

33.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $1,275.90 $1,329.10 $1,435.00 $1,472.20 $1,495.57 $1,765.88

33.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,243.19 $1,295.00 $1,435.00 $1,413.31 $1,495.57 $1,721.18

33.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

34 DPAC 24402312A1A11840

34.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,065.13 $2,151.20 $2,265.00 $2,416.21 $2,360.15 $2,858.82

34.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,013.50 $2,097.40 $2,265.00 $2,323.28 $2,360.15 $2,787.06

34.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,961.87 $2,043.60 $2,265.00 $2,230.34 $2,360.15 $2,715.29

34.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

35 Satellite Network Clock 2488PRAX2281CX23X

35.1 1-4 units 1 EA $8,593.97 $8,952.10 $9,435.00 $10,054.94 $9,821.68 $11,895.29

35.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $8,379.12 $8,728.30 $9,435.00 $9,668.21 $9,821.68 $11,597.65

35.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $8,164.27 $8,504.40 $9,435.00 $9,821.48 $9,821.68 $11,300.00

35.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

36 Managed Ethernet Switch 2730M0APAX1111AAAAX0
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36.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,163.27 $3,295.10 $3,470.00 $3,701.02 $3,615.17 $4,377.65

36.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,084.19 $3,212.70 $3,470.00 $3,558.68 $3,615.17 $4,268.24

36.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,005.11 $3,130.30 $3,470.00 $3,416.33 $3,615.17 $4,158.82

36.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

37 Managed Ethernet Switch 2730M0ARAX1111AAAAX0

37.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,000.00 $3,125.00 $3,290.00 $3,510.00 $3,428.57 $4,151.76

37.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,925.00 $3,046.90 $3,290.00 $3,375.00 $3,428.57 $4,048.24

37.3 20+ Units 1 EA $2,850.00 $2,968.80 $3,290.00 $3,240.00 $3,428.57 $3,944.71

37.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

38 Unmanaged Ethernet Switch 2730U0APAX1111AAAAX0

38.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,207.20 $2,299.20 $2,420.00 $2,582.42 $2,522.51 $3,055.29

38.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,152.02 $2,241.70 $2,420.00 $2,483.10 $2,522.51 $2,978.82

38.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $2,096.84 $2,184.20 $2,420.00 $2,383.78 $2,522.51 $2,902.35

38.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

39 Unmanaged Ethernet Switch 2730U0ARAX1111AAAAX0

39.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,043.93 $2,129.10 $2,245.00 $2,391.40 $2,335.92 $2,829.41

39.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $1,992.83 $2,075.90 $2,245.00 $2,299.43 $2,335.92 $2,758.82

39.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $1,941.73 $2,022.60 $2,245.00 $2,207.45 $2,335.92 $2,687.06

39.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

40 Unmanaged Ethernet Switch 2730U0ARAX1113AAAAX0

40.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,190.53 $3,323.50 $3,505.00 $3,732.87 $3,646.32 $4,416.47

40.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,110.77 $3,240.40 $3,505.00 $3,589.30 $3,646.32 $4,305.88

40.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,031.00 $3,157.30 $3,505.00 $3,445.73 $3,646.32 $4,195.29

40.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

41 Automation Controller 3355#FH8B

41.1 1-4 units 1 EA $10,892.10 $11,345.90 $11,960.00 $12,743.76 $12,448.11 $15,025.29

41.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $10,619.80 $11,062.30 $11,960.00 $12,253.61 $12,448.11 $14,698.82

41.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $10,347.50 $10,778.60 $11,960.00 $11,763.47 $12,448.11 $14,322.35

41.4 Delivery 5 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

42 Automation Controller 3355#YVYT

42.1 1-4 units 1 EA $8,929.99 $9,302.10 $9,805.00 $10,448.09 $10,205.70 $12,360.00

42.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $8,706.74 $9,069.50 $9,805.00 $10,046.24 $10,205.70 $12,050.59

42.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $8,483.49 $8,837.00 $9,805.00 $9,644.39 $10,205.70 $11,742.35

42.4 Delivery 5 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

43 Automation Controller 3355#D0LG

43.1 1-4 units 1 EA $10,336.48 $10,767.20 $11,350.00 $12,093.68 $11,813.12 $14,307.56

43.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $10,078.07 $10,498.00 $11,350.00 $11,628.54 $11,813.12 $13,949.41

43.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $9,819.66 $10,228.80 $11,350.00 $11,163.40 $11,813.12 $13,591.76

43.4 Delivery 5 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

44 Port Server 3610X3A0XXX0

44.1 1-4 units 1 EA $2,442.75 $2,544.50 $2,680.00 $2,858.02 $2,791.71 $3,381.18

44.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $2,381.68 $2,480.90 $2,680.00 $2,748.10 $2,791.71 $3,296.47

44.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $2,320.61 $2,417.30 $2,680.00 $2,638.18 $2,791.71 $3,211.76
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44.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

45 Ethernet Security Gateway 3620X3A0XXX0

45.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,788.75 $3,946.60 $4,160.00 $4,432.84 $4,330.00 $5,243.53

45.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,694.03 $3,847.90 $4,160.00 $4,262.35 $4,330.00 $5,112.94

45.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,599.31 $3,749.30 $4,160.00 $4,091.86 $4,330.00 $4,981.18

45.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2 3

46 Feeder Protection Relay 751501A4A2A7085AG30

46.1 1-4 units 1 EA $6,939.40 $7,228.50 $7,615.00 $8,119.10 $7,930.74 $9,604.71

46.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $6,765.92 $7,047.80 $7,615.00 $7,806.83 $7,930.74 $9,364.71

46.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $6,592.43 $6,867.10 $7,615.00 $7,494.55 $7,930.74 $9,124.71

46.4 Delivery 3 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2

47 Control Switch Module 951031B2

47.1 1-4 units 1 EA $488.37 $508.70 $535.00 $634.88 $558.14 $676.47

47.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $488.37 $508.70 $535.00 $610.46 $558.14 $676.47

47.3 20+ Units 1 EA $488.37 $508.70 $535.00 $586.04 $558.14 $676.47

47.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2

48 Ethernet Switch

48.1 1-4 units 1 EA $587.01 $611.50 $640.00 $686.80 $670.87 $812.94

48.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $572.33 $596.20 $640.00 $660.39 $670.87 $791.76

48.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $557.66 $580.90 $640.00 $633.97 $670.87 $771.76

48.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2

49 Ethernet Switch

49.1 1-4 units 1 EA $3,862.50 $4,023.40 $4,240.00 $4,519.13 $4,414.29 $5,345.88

49.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,765.94 $3,922.90 $4,240.00 $4,345.31 $4,414.29 $5,212.94

49.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,669.38 $3,822.30 $4,240.00 $4,171.50 $4,414.29 $5,078.82

49.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2

50 Ethernet Switch

50.1 1-4 units 1 EA $4,032.45 $4,200.50 $4,425.00 $4,717.97 $4,608.51 $5,581.18

50.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $3,931.64 $4,095.50 $4,425.00 $4,536.51 $4,608.51 $5,441.18

50.3 20 - 49 Units 1 EA $3,830.83 $3,990.40 $4,425.00 $4,355.05 $4,608.51 $5,302.35

50.4 Delivery 2 Weeks ARO 2 32 8 2

51

52 PRP Driver for Windows 5815-0001

52.1 1-4 units 1 EA $1,211.40 $1,261.90 $1,330.00 $1,574.82 $1,384.46 $1,676.47

52.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $1,211.40 $1,261.90 $1,330.00 $1,514.25 $1,384.46 $1,676.47

52.3 20+ Units 1 EA $1,211.40 $1,261.90 $1,330.00 $1,453.68 $1,384.46 $1,676.47

52.4 Delivery 1 WK 2 32 8 2 0

53 SFP 8109-01

53.1 1-4 units 1 EA $100.00 $104.20 $105.00 $130.00 $114.29 $138.82

53.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $100.00 $104.20 $105.00 $125.00 $114.29 $138.82

53.3 20+ Units 1 EA $100.00 $104.20 $105.00 $120.00 $114.29 $138.82

53.4 Delivery 1 Wk 2 32 8 2

54 SFP Transceiver - single mode 8130-01

SECTION 2 - MISCELLANEOUS HARDWARE AND CABLES
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54.1 1-4 units 1 EA $218.00 $227.10 $235.00 $283.40 $249.14 $301.17

54.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $218.00 $227.10 $235.00 $272.50 $249.14 $301.17

54.3 20+ Units 1 EA $218.00 $227.10 $235.00 $261.60 $249.14 $301.17

54.4 Delivery 1 WK 2 32 8 2

55 SFP Transceiver - multi mode 8131-01

55.1 1-4 units 1 EA $100.00 $104.20 $105.00 $130.00 $249.14 $138.82

55.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $100.00 $104.20 105 $125.00 $249.14 $138.82

55.3 20+ Units 1 EA $100.00 $104.20 $105.00 $120.00 $249.14 $138.82

55.4 Delivery 1 Wk 2 32 8 2

56 Keyboard w/ mouse and locking tray 91610050-L

56.1 1-4 units 1 EA $995.42 $1,036.90 $1,090.00 $1,294.05 No Bid $1,377.65

56.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $995.42 $1,036.90 $1,090.00 $1,244.28 No Bid $1,377.65

56.3 20+ Units 1 EA $995.42 $1,036.90 $1,090.00 $1,194.50 No Bid $1,377.65

56.4 Delivery 1 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

57 Power Supply 9331A101X2

57.1 1-4 units 1 EA $520.95 $542.70 $570.00 $677.24 No Bid $721.18

57.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $520.95 $542.70 $570.00 $651.19 No Bid $721.18

57.3 20+ Units 1 EA $520.95 $542.70 $570.00 $625.14 No Bid $721.18

57.4 Delivery 2 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

58 Gas Tube Coaxial Surge Protector

58.1 1-4 units 1 EA $143.32 $149.30 $30.00 $186.32 No Bid $198.82

58.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $143.32 $149.30 $30.00 $179.15 No Bid $198.82

58.3 20+ Units 1 EA $143.32 $149.30 $30.00 $171.98 No Bid $198.82

58.4 Delivery 1 WK 2 32 8 No Bid

59 Mounting Bracket for Surge Protector

59.1 1-4 units 1 EA $8.09 $8.40 $0.00 $186.32 No Bid $11.76

59.2 5-19 Units 1 EA $8.09 $8.40 $0.00 $179.15 No Bid $11.76

59.3 20+ Units 1 EA $8.09 $8.40 $0.00 $171.98 No Bid $11.76

59.4 Delivery 1 Wk 2 0 8 No Bid

60
RG-58A/U Coaxial Cable with BNC male 

connectors on both ends, 2' length C953 1

60.1 Each 1 EA $31.47 $32.80 $30.00 $40.91 No Bid $43.53

60.2 *Addition cable over 2' - RG-58A/U 1 EA $32.19 $33.50 $0.00 $40.91 No Bid $44.71

60.3 Delivery 2 WK 2 32 8 No Bid

61
RG-58A/U Coaxial Cable with BNC male 

connector to ferrule connector, 2' length* C962

61.1 Each 1 EA $31.47 $32.80 $30.00 $40.91 No Bid $43.53

61.2 *Addition cable over 2' - RG-58A/U 1 FT $32.19 $33.50 $0.00 $40.91 No Bid $44.71

61.3 Delivery 1 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

62
RG-58A/U Coaxial Cable with BNC male 

connector to ferrule connector, 2' length*

62.1 Each 1 EA $31.47 $32.80 $30.00 $40.91 No Bid $43.53

62.2 *Addition cable over 2' - RG-58A/U 1 FT $32.19 $33.50 $0.00 $42.78 No Bid $44.71
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62.3 Delivery 2 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

63
RG-8 Coaxial Cable with TNC male 

connectors on both ends, 8' length** C965C

63.1 Each 1 EA $62.76 $65.40 $65.00 $73.42 No Bid $87.06

63.2 **Addition cable over 8' - RG-8 1 FT $64.98 $67.70 $0.00 $46.53 No Bid $89.41

63.3 Delivery 2 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

64
EIA-232 serial adapter cable with IRIG-B - 

9 pin Male to Female BNC, 6' length C478N

64.1 Each 1 EA $44.28 $46.10 $50.00 $57.56 No Bid $61.18

64.2 Delivery 2 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

65
EIA-232 serial adapter cable with IRIG-B - 

9 pin Male to 9 pin Male, 8' length C273A

65.1 Each 1 EA $47.03 $49.00 $55.00 $61.14 No Bid $64.71

65.2 Delivery 2 Wk 2 32 8 No Bid

$899,538.74 $937,020.20 $1,010,645.00 $1,041,040.27 $1,046,919.18 $1,244,999.26Total:


