Exhibit 2
RFP 8864 - Pricing Evaluation for Electric Utility Distribution Hardware - Fuses and Arms

Respondent's Business Name:
Principal Place of Business (City and State):

Techline

Stuart C. Irby

Texas Electric
Cooperatives

Parrish-Hare Supply,
LLC

Fort Worth, TX

Fort Worth, TX

Georgetown, TX

Irving, TX

Line # Description [ Migr Mfgno [QTY[uOM] Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended | Unit | Extended [ Unit | Extended
1 |[SECTION A: FUSING AND PROTECTION-KEARNEY
2 |FUSE LINK, 10 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51010 200 |EA $7.75| $1,550.00] $7.04| $1,408.00f NoBid| $1,570.00| $7.85| $1,570.00
3 |FUSE LINK, 100 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51100 150 [EA $14.50| $2,175.00] $14.78| $2,217.00/ NoBid | $2,427.00| $16.18| $2,427.00
4 |FUSE LINK, 12 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51012 75 [EA $7.75 $581.25| $7.04 $528.00{ No Bid $588.75| $7.85 $588.75
5 |FUSE LINK, 140 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51140 50 [EA $33.85| $1,692.50] $38.00| $1,900.00f NoBid [ $1,941.00| $38.82| $1,941.00
6 |FUSE LINK, 15 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51015 100 [EA $7.75 $775.00] $7.04 $704.00{ No Bid $785.00f $7.85 $785.00
7 |FUSELINK,2 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51002 5 [EA $7.75 $38.75] $8.45 $42.25| No Bid $51.90| $10.38 $51.90
8 |FUSE LINK, 20 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51020 75 [EA $7.75 $581.25| $7.04 $528.00{ No Bid $693.00( $9.24 $693.00
9 |FUSE LINK, 25 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51025 50 [EA $7.75 $387.50] $7.04 $352.00{ No Bid $462.00( $9.24 $462.00
10 |FUSE LINK,3AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51003 75 [EA $7.75 $581.25| $7.04 $528.00{ No Bid $588.75| $7.85 $588.75
11 |FUSE LINK, 30 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51030 50 [EA $7.75 $387.50] $7.74 $387.00{ No Bid $462.00( $9.24 $462.00
12 |FUSE LINK, 40 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51040 125 [EA $7.75 $968.75| $8.45| $1,056.25| NoBid| $1,155.00/ $9.24| $1,155.00
13 |FUSE LINK, 50 AMP K +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 31050 100 [EA $7.75 $775.00] $8.10 $810.00{ No Bid $866.00( $8.66 $866.00
14 |FUSE LINK, 50 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51050 50 [EA $7.75 $387.50] $8.10 $405.00{ No Bid $462.00( $9.24 $462.00
15 |FUSE LINK, 6 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51006 225 |EA $7.75| $1,743.75] $7.04| $1,584.00f NoBid| $1,766.25| $7.85| $1,766.25
16 |FUSE LINK, 65 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51065 350 |[EA $12.50| $4,375.00] $13.38| $4,683.00/ NoBid[ $4,935.00| $14.10{ $4,935.00
17 |FUSE LINK, 8 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY# 51008 10 |EA $7.75 $77.50] $7.04 $70.40{ No Bid $78.50| $7.85 $78.50
18 |FUSE LINK, 80 AMP T +\ Kearney KEARNEY #51080 50 [EA $12.50 $625.00] $15.49 $774.50| No Bid $809.00| $16.18 $809.00
19 |Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above. 15.0% 10.0% 0.0% 39.0%
20 |Estimated Delivery (Business Days) |Days 30 21 28 2
21 |SECTION B: FUSING AND PROTECTION-S&C FUSES
22 [FUSE, S&C 100E + S&C SMU-20, #612100 5 |EA $223.00( $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
23 [FUSE, S&C 10E + S&C SMU-20 #612010 5 |EA $223.00( $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
24 [FUSE, S&C 150E + SMU SMU-20 #612150 15 |EA $223.00{ $3,345.00] $181.92| $2,728.80| $208.80| $3,132.00| No Bid | $3,450.00
25 [FUSE, S&C 15E + S&C SMU-20 #612015 5 |EA $223.00( $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
26 |FUSE, S&C 20E S&C SMU-20, #612020 5 |EA $223.00( $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
27 [FUSE, S&C 25E + S&C SMU-20 #612025 5 |EA $223.00f $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
28 [FUSE, S&C 40E + S&C SMU-20 #612040 5 |EA $223.00( $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
29 [FUSE, S&C 50E + S&C SMU-20, #612050 5 |EA $223.00f $1,115.00] $181.92 $909.60| $208.80| $1,044.00| No Bid| $1,150.00
30 [FUSE, S&C 65E + S&C SMU-20, #612065 80 [EA $223.00{ $17,840.00] $181.92| $14,553.60| $208.80| $16,704.00| No Bid | $18,400.00
31 [FFUSE, S&C 80E + S&C SMU-20, #612080 10 |EA $223.00{ $2,230.00f $181.92| $1,819.20| $208.80| $2,088.00| No Bid | $2,300.00
32 [FUSE, S&C, END FITTING + S&C SML20-3097- (CABINET FUSE) ONLY 5 [EA $585.00{ $2,925.00] $473.94| $2,369.70| $543.95| $2,719.75| NoBid | $3,025.00
33 [FUSE, S&C, END FITTING, PME GEAR+  |S&C SME#20 3093 15 |EA $590.00{ $8,850.00) $532.47| $7,987.05| $550.00| $8,250.00| No Bid | $9,150.00
34 [Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above. 25.0% 5.0% 0.0% 0.0%
35 |[Estimated Delivery (Business Days) |Days 210 180 182 No Bid
36 [SECTION C: WOOD ARMS
37 [BRACE, CROSSARM WOOD 60" + Brooks/Hubbell |]ALUMAFRM RA6018/ HPS PSCRA6018 500 |PR $35.00| $17,500.00] $31.66( $15,830.00{ $31.31| $15,655.00| No Bid | $17,500.00
38 |[ARM WOOD 3 3/4" x 4 3/4" X 8'+ Brooks BROOKS LUMBER BXARMS8FC 350 |[EA $105.00{ $36,750.00] No Bid | $36,750.00| $92.91| $32,518.50| No Bid | $36,750.00
39 [ARM WOOD 3.75"X4.75"X10' + Brooks BROOKS LUMBER BXARM10FC / TYPE-05FS 300 |[EA $128.00{ $38,400.00] No Bid | $38,400.00| $114.95| $34,485.00| No Bid | $38,400.00
40 [Discount off List Price for Special Order Items in this category not mentioned above. 25.0% No Bid 0.0% No Bid
41 |[Estimated Delivery (Business Days) | 1 |Days 7 21 28 No Bid No Bid

Total: $153,347.50 $144,782.95 $142,501.40 $156,666.15




Evaluation

Item #

Scoring Criteria

Stuart C. Irby

Texas Electric

Parrish-Hare Supply,

Techline, Inc. Cooperatives LLC

1|Price - 30% 25.07 29.53 30.00 27.29
2|Schedule - 20% 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00
3|Probable Performance - 20% 20.00 15.00 15.00 15.00
4|Compliance with Specifications - 30% 30.00 24.00 18.00 18.00
Total Score: 90.07 83.53 78.00 75.29




