Exhibit 2
IFB 8634 - Bid Tabulation for Supply of Communication Inventory

e s L Texas Ele_ctric Adam_s Cable Commgnications_and Anixter Inc.
Respondent's Business Name: Cooperatives Equipment Electrical Supplies
Principal Place of Business (City and State): Plano, TX Georgetown, TX Lenexa, KS Neosho, MO Denton, TX
Line # Description | Mfgr | Mfgno [QTY]uoM| Unit | Extended Unit | Extended | Unit [ Extended | Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
1 SECTION A- COMMUNICATIONS SUPPLIES - BRAND EQUIVALENTS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED
2 CABLE, SIAMESE CAT 5E +16/2STR Belden #5288US 20 RL $510.84| $10,216.80| $589.00/$11,780.00( $522.22| $10,444.40|NOBID| $ 11,780.00 $458.73 $9,174.60
3 CABLE, SIAMESE CAT 5E4PRI 2C16 CMR SHIELDED Belden #Y636880101000 |20 RL $1,101.60| $22,032.00| $843.90($16,878.00| $943.00| $18,860.00|NOBID| $ 22,032.00 $993.00|  $19,860.00
Beldon #IBDN25R/
4 CABLE, 25PAIR CAT5E (2500/RL) Belden/Hitachi |Hitachi #3009-50 5 RL $2,808.00| $14,040.00|$3,988.90({$19,944.50({$8,833.33| $44,166.65|NO BID| $ 62,700.00 |$12,540.00|  $62,700.00
5 WIRE, TRACE 19STR BARE CU Anixter #6G-1401-02 15 RL $294.30 $4,414.50| $125.90 $1,888.50| $319.44| $4,791.60|NOBID| $ 4,791.60 $108.55 $1,628.25
FRM-4RU-12X-TS-S
6 CABINET, 72 PATCH PANEL Multilink BK BK 100 |EA $305.37| $30,537.00| $295.20{$29,520.00| $264.19 $26,419.00| $273.36] $27,336.00| $272.39| $27,239.00
FAA-03, AFL
! ADHESIVE, RIBBON FORMING 40Z AFL #5008720 ONLY 15 EA $58.00 $870.00| $56.70/ $850.50| $51.31 $769.65|NOBID| $  870.00 $51.61 $774.15
8 SLEEVE, 40MM RIBBON (50/PKG) CESI #680X640 ONLY |30 PK $57.51| $1,725.30( $44.30] $1,329.00f $19.11 $573.30| $15.50 $465.00 $7.25 $217.50
9 SPLICE CASE, X-LARGE FIBER, 3M 3M 2178LL 15 EA $281.88 $4,228.20| $388.50( $5,827.50| $802.34| $12,035.10|NO BID| $ 12,035.10 $325.52 $4,882.80
10 [BRACKET KIT, AERIAL HANGER 3M 2197 15 EA $88.67| $1,330.05[ $83.70| $1,255.50/ NOBID| $ 1,330.00 [NOBID| $ 1,330.00 $77.76 $1,166.40
11  [SPLICE CASE L/S EXPANSION KIT 3M 2181-LS 10 EA $105.41 $1,054.10| $166.40 $1,664.00| $150.79| $1,507.90|NO BID| $ 1,874.00 $187.40 $1,874.00
12 |CABLE, 24 FIBER OPTIC (FT) OFS AT-3CE833X-024  |30000|EA $0.56| $16,800.00 $0.50{$15,000.00 $0.39] $11,700.00| $0.463| $13,890.00 $0.44|  $13,200.00
13 [SWITCH, MANAGED POE, 8PORTS Netgear GS110TP-300NAS (20 EA $206.28 $4,125.60| $230.70| $4,614.00{ NO BID 6103.80 [NOBID| $ 6,103.80 $305.19 $6,103.80
14  [SWITCH, MANAGED POE, 24PORTS Netgear GS728TP-200NAS |5 EA $437.40 $2,187.00) NOBID| $3,235.35 NOBID 3235.35|NOBID| $ 3,235.35 $647.07 $3,235.35
15 [SECTION B- COMMUNICATIONS SUPPLIES - BRAND EQUIVALENTS WILL BE ACCEPTED
16 [BULK HEAD, FIBER ST SINGLEMODE 380 |EA $19.49 $7,406.20] $19.00 $7,220.00{ $17.40| $6,612.00| $17.32 $6,581.60 $17.46 $6,634.80
17 |[BULK HEAD FIBER LC-LC 250 |EA $24.19 $6,047.50] $24.30| $6,075.00| $22.31| $5,577.50| $22.35 $5,587.50 $22.38 $5,595.00
18 [RIBBON FIBER PROTECTOR 150 |[EA $2.86 $429.00 $2.90/  $435.00 $3.03 $454.50| $2.88 $432.00 $2.63 $394.50
19 [FANOUT KIT FIBER LC TO RIBBON 400 |EA $88.70/$35,480.00(  $84.21| $33,684.00| $36.00| $14,400.00f NOBID| $ 35,480.00
19 ALT1 2 METER 12F, LC/OPEN, PVC, JACKETED RIBBON, 24" NP12SMRIB-LC-2M:;
900UM NET SOURCE [VBO9 400 |EA $42.44| $16,976.00
FIS/RF-9-LU-P-S-1-FISC-TLC-RI-12-Z91 meter 12-fiber
Yellow OFNR (Riser) TLC Ribbon Fan-Out cable, 9m SM
19 ALT1|SMF-28 Ultra fiber, LC/UPC FISC connectors to Pigtail with
900m buildup on Side A FIS Patchcord on Hand Coil No RF-9-LU-P-S-1-FISCH
spool4 Weeks Leadtime FIS TLC-RI-12-79 400 |EA
20 |FANOUT KIT FIBER ST TO RIBBON 50 EA $88.70| $4,435.00f $82.35] $4,117.50 $34.00 $1,700.00) NOBID| $ 4,435.00
2 METER 12F, ST/OPEN, PVC, JACKETED RIBBON, 24" NP12SMRIB-ST-2M-
20ALTL 900UM NET SOURCE [VBO9 50 EA $58.32( $ 2,916.00
RF-9-8U-P-S-1-FISC-TLC-RI-12-Z91 meter 12-fiber Yellow
OFNR (Riser) TLC Ribbon Fan-Out cable, 9m SM SMF-28
20 ALT1|Ultra fiber, ST/UPC FISC connectors to Pigtail with 900m
buildup on Side A FIS Patchcord on Hand Coil No spool4 RF-9-8U-P-S-1-FISC-
Weeks FIS TL C-RI-12-79 50 EA
21  |H-BRACKET, W/LARGE HOOKS 25 EA NOBID| $ 9,427.00 | $377.10 $9,427.50| NOBID| $ 9,427.50 |[INOBID| $ 9,427.50 NOBID[$ 9,427.00
22 |PANEL, BLANK MULTIPLATE 20 EA $4.48 $89.60 $4.40 $88.00 $5.16 $103.20|NO BID| $ 103.20 $4.00 $80.00
23 [SPLICE TRAY. 4"X12" AL 100 |EA $44.39 $4,439.00] $38.90| $3,890.00 $18.50 $1,850.00 $35.83 $3,583.00
23 ALT1 Splice tray: 24 port single fusion splice tray, metal, DOES
NOT include protective sleeves 5 days Lynn ST-M-24 100 |EA $19.03/ $ 1,903.00
24  |LIGHTING ARRESTOR ETHERNET 20 EA $82.13 $1,642.60] $68.80 $1,376.00] $97.01| $1,940.20|NOBID[ $ 1,940.20 $86.30 $1,726.00
25 |CONNECTOR KIT - ADSS 10 EA $100.76 $1,007.60] $97.60[ $976.00{ $96.84 $968.40|NO BID| $ 1,007.60 $91.59 $915.90
26 |ENCLOSURE, SPLICE OPGW 25 EA | $1,048.30| $26,207.50] $950.00/$23,750.00| $767.24| $19,181.00|NO BID| $ 26,207.50 $864.30|  $21,607.50
27 |SFP TRANSCEIVER 10K SINGLEMODE 20 EA $15.20| $304.00f NO BID $228.60|NO BID[ $  447.00 $22.35 $447.00
Generic Compatible SFP 1000BASE-LX/LH 1310nm 10km
2T ALTL DOM Duplex LC/UPC SMF Optical Transceiver Module FS 75326 20 EA
27 ALT1|10GBASE-LR SFP+ SINGLE MODE LC MODULE TRENDNET |TEG-10GBS10 20 EA $75.60[ $ 1,512.00
Total: $191,660.55 $207,243.35 $226,134.15 $238,126.95 $242,381.55




