
Stuart C. Irby C E S I 
Protective 

Equipment Testing 

Texas Electric 

Cooperatives

Titan Utility 

Services

Fort Worth, TX Walters, OK Great Bend, KS Georgetown, TX Tickfaw, LA

Line # Description UOM Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit

2 Test of Utility Rubber Gloves EA $3.64 $4.25 $6.75 $4.57 no bid

3 Test of Utility Rubber Sleeves EA $6.98 $6.45 $9.75 $6.94 no bid

Section B-Testing of Utility Rubber Goods

5 Test of Utility Rubber Goods Cover-Up EA $7.28 $13.00 $10.50 $13.98 $14.00

6 Test of Utility Rubber Goods Blanket EA $7.68 $10.00 $10.00 $10.76 $14.00

7 Test of Utility Rubber Goods Guts-Rubber EA $7.28 $14.25 $10.50 $15.33 $14.00

8 Test of Utility Rubber Goods Plastic EA $7.28 $13.75 $10.00 $14.79 $14.00

10 Disposal of Failed Items No Charge No Charge No Charge 100.0% no bid

Replacement of Failed Items 25.0% 10.0% 10.0% 10.0% 0.0%

14 Protective Bags to Carry Rubber Gloves and/or Sleeves 25.0% 5.0% 10.0% 5.0% 0.0%

16 Rubber gloves/sleeves, rubber cover-ups/guts in addition to current stock 25.0% 10.0% 10.0% 10.0% 0.0%

18 Leather Gloves designed to go over utility rubber gloves-Primary Per Pair $39.00 $49.28 $48.90 $52.99 no bid

19 Leather Gloves designed to go over utility rubber gloves-Secondary Per Pair $31.00 $38.18 $40.47 $41.06 no bid

21 Goat Leather Gloves- Arc 23cal, puncture rating 4, NFPA PPE level 2 Per Pair $33.75 $37.18 $63.00 $39.98 no bid

23 Straps and Clips that attach to sleeves to keep them in place. 25.0% 5.0% 10.0% 5.0% 0.0%

Item # Stuart C. Irby C E S I
Protective 

Equipment Testing 

Texas Electric 

Cooperatives

Titan Utility 

Services

1 18.00 13.00 10.00 9.00 8.00

2 27.00 15.00 19.50 15.00 6.00

3 18.00 14.00 12.00 9.00 7.00

4 30.00 29.77 26.43 27.68 24.16

93.00 71.77 67.93 60.68 45.16Total Score:

Standard Criteria

Delivery/Project Schedule - 20%

Compliance with Specifications - 30%

Probable Performance - 20%

Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 30%

Respondent's Business Name:

Principal Place of Business (City and State):

Exhibit 2

RFP 8877 - Pricing Evaluation for Dielectric Testing of Utility Rubber

Evaluation

Section I-Sleeve Straps an Clips

Section A-Testing of Utility Rubber Gloves/Sleeves

Section C-Disposal of Failed Items

Section D-Replacement Equipment

Section E-Glove/Sleeve Bags

Section F-New Equipment

Section G-Leather Protectors for Utility Rubber Gloves

Section H-Leather Work Gloves


