Exhibit 2

RFP 8980 - Pricing Evaluation for Supply of Hot Mix Asphalt

Respondent's Business Name:
Principal Place of Business (City and State):

Primary

Secondary

Jagoe-Public

Eurovia Atlantic

David-Tehoungue Ltd

Compan Coast LLC dba Austin Asphalt Co
pany Sunmount Paving
Denton, TX Justin, TX Coppell, TX Hickory Creek, TX

Line #

Description

| QrY |[uOM

Unit | Extended

Unit | Extended

Unit | Extended

Unit | Extended

SECTION 1 - Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete (PG-64-22) --- 100% SAC-A AGGREGATE MIXES

OPTION 1A -- Pickup at plant Hot Mix

2 |Asphalt Concrete (PG-64-22) (for City Crew

patching or installation) 8,000 [TON | $92.00| $736,000.00] $79.00| $632,000.00] $78.50| $628,000.00($230.00|$1,840,000.00
3 OPTION 1B -- F.O.B DELIVERY Hot Mix

Asphalt Concrete (PG-64-22) 8,000 [TON | $103.00| $824,000.00] $93.00| $744,000.00] $89.50( $716,000.00($230.00|$1,840,000.00
4 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (0-400 tons) 10,000 |TON | $40.00| $400,000.00] $55.25| $552,500.00] No Bid| $3,230,000.00]$323.00] $3,230,000.00
5 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (400-999 tons) 11,000 |TON | $16.00| $176,000.00] $33.00| $363,000.00] No Bid| $3,553,000.00]|$323.00| $3,553,000.00
6 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (1,000-1,999 tons) 12,000 |TON | $14.00| $168,000.00] $15.75| $189,000.00] No Bid| $3,876,000.00]|$323.00| $3,876,000.00

Adder per ton for contractor installation at
7 |City of Denton job site. (2,000-4,000 tons) | 10,000 [TON | $11.00] $110,000.00 $15.75| $157,500.00] No Bid| $3,230,000.00|$323.00{ $3.230,000.00
8 [SECTION 2 - Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete (PG-76-22) --- 100% SAC-A AGGREGATE MIXES

OPTION 2A -- Pickup at plant Hot Mix
9 |Asphalt Concrete (PG-76-22)(for City Crew

patching or installation) 2,000 |TON | $98.00 $196,000.00] $91.00| $182,000.00] $93.50| $187,000.00{$230.00( $460,000.00
10 OPTION 2B -- F.0.B DELIVERY Hot Mix

Asphalt Concrete (PG-76-22) 2,000 |TON | $109.00( $218,000.00] $105.00| $210,000.00§ $104.50| $209,000.00{$230.00( $460,000.00
1 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (0-400 tons) 2,000 [TON $40.00( $80,000.00] $55.25| $110,500.00] No Bid| $646,000.00|$323.00( $646,000.00
12 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (400-999 tons) 2,000 [TON $16.00( $32,000.00] $33.00| $66,000.00] No Bid| $646,000.00|$323.00( $646,000.00
13 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (1,000-1,999 tons) 2,000 [TON $14.00( $28,000.00] $15.75| $31,500.00] No Bid| $646,000.00|$323.00( $646,000.00
14 Adder per ton for contractor installation at

City of Denton job site. (2,000-4,000 tons) 2,000 |TON | $11.00f $22,000.00] $15.75| $31,500.00] No Bid| $646,000.00|$323.00( $646,000.00




Exhibit 2
RFP 8980 - Pricing Evaluation for Supply of Hot Mix Asphalt

Primary Secondary
Total: $2,990,000.00 $3,269,500.00 $18,213,000.00 | $21,073,000.00 |
Evaluation
. Eurovia Atlantic .
Item # Scoring Criteria Jagoe-Public Coast LLC dba Austin Asphalt David-Tehoungue Ltd
Company . Co
Sunmount Paving
1|Material Availability-30% 30.00 19.50 16.50 15.00
2|Compliance with Specifications-20% 20.00 14.00 13.00 13.00
3|Probable Performance-20% 19.00 14.00 10.00 11.00
4|Price, Total Cost of Ownership-30% 30.00 27.44 4.93 4.26
Total Score: 99.00 74.94 44.43 43.26




