Exhibit 2
RFP 8882 - Pricing Evaluation for Household Hazardous Waste Disposal

Clean Harbors Clean Earth Tradebe Triumvirate
Environmental Environmental |Environmental| Environmental | Enviroserve
Respondent's Business Name: Services Inc Solutions Inc. Services, LLC| Services, LLC
Principal Place of Business (City and State):|  Norwell, MA _ [King of Prussia, PA| ™ """ | Davie, FL _|Fort Worth, TX
Line #| Description [QTY] UOM Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing
Section A - Household Hazardous Waste Material
2 |Flammable Solids (Loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $295.00 $280.00 $452.00 $3,274.71
3 |Flammable Liquids (Loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $270.00 $488.00 $377.00 $378.57
4 |Aerosols (Loose pack) 1 Cu Yd Box $658.00 $594.00 $1,092.00 $693.00 $1,428.57
5 [Pesticide Solids (Loose pack) 1 Cu Yd Box $658.00 $750.00 $1,727.00 $473.00 $485.71
6 |Pesticide Liquid(loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $270.00 $585.00 $337.00 $1,000.00
7 |Gasoline (Bulk) 1 IBC Tote $360.00 $425.00 $556.00 $650.00 $750.00
8 |Oil-Based Paint (bulk) 1 55 Gallon $94.00 $148.00 $246.00 $177.00 $350.00
9  |Non-Hazardous solids Waste Cleaner 1 55 Gallon $89.00 $148.50 $118.00 $237.00 $135.71
10 |Non-Hazardous liquids Waste Cleaner 1 55 Gallon $56.00 $115.00 $137.00 $277.00 $157.14
11 |Corrosives (inorganic base--loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $270.00 $306.00 $337.00 $1,030.00
12 |Corrosives (inorganic acid--loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $270.00 $306.00 $337.00 $1,030.00
13 |Alkaline Batteries 1 55 Gallon $244.00 $355.00 $500.00 $517.00 $500.00
14 |Oxidizer Other (Loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $486.00 $375.00 $577.00 $3,357.14
15 |Oxidizer-organic(loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $486.00 $1,566.00 $677.00 $3,357.14
16 |Oxidizer-inorganic(loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $486.00 $375.00 $577.00 $2,145.00
17 |Oxidizer-hypochlorite(loose pack) 1 55 Gallon $188.00 $486.00 $727.00 $577.00 $2,145.00
18 |Lamps Incandescent (Crushed or uncrushed) 1 55 Gallon $199.00 $425.00 $125.00 $582.00 $395.00
19 |Lamps (LED,CFL) (Crushed or uncrushed) 1 55 Gallon $199.00 $425.00 $380.00 $582.00 $395.00
20 |Oil filter 1 55 Gallon $72.00 $250.00 $167.00 $187.00 $120.00
21 [Fire Extinguishers 1 55 Gallon $299.00 $425.00 $125.00 $337.00 $357.00
22 |Lithium Batteries 1 55 Gallon $387.00 $425.00 $2,875.00| $2,875 - no bid $350.00
23 |Lithium Batteries (Damaged) 1 5 Gallon $74.70 $495.00 $265.00 $140.00 $190.00
24 |Lithium ION Batteries 1 55 Gallon $387.00 $235.00 $375.00 $377.00 $350.00
25 |Amines (loose/lab pack) 1 5 Gallon $56.40 $103.00 $178.00 $147.00 $235.00
26 |Non-Hazardous 1 Cu Yd Box $311.50 $594.00 $502.00 $413.00 $125.00
27 |Hydrogen Peroxide 10% or less (loose/lab pack) 1 5 Gallon $93.00 $175.00 $178.00 $187.00 $65.00
28 |Organic Peroxide(loose/lab pack) 1 55 Gallon $310.00 $850.00 $1,566.00 $652.00 $3,357.14
29 [Nitrates (loose/lab pack) 1 5 Gallon $56.40 $175.00 $116.00 $162.00 $357.00
30 |Mercury containing 1 5 Gallon $828.90 $550.00 $980.00 $892.00 $535.00
31 |Vapes (Complete) 1 5 Gallon $249.00 $495.00 $265.00 $122.00 $275.00
32 |Waste Oil 1 IBC Tote $390.00 $425.00 $526.00 $510.00 $265.00
33 |Anti-freeze 1 IBC Tote $445.00 $425.00 $526.00 $840.00 $265.00
Section B - Transportation
35 |Transportation Charges, full or partial load 1 Per Trip $567.00 No Charge $4,250.00 $4,250 - no bid $1,170.00
36 |Pick up & Mobilization 1 Per Trip $175.00 No Charge $250.00 $780 - no bid $780.00
37 |EPA Waste Manifest fee 1 Per Trip $27.00 $25.00 $25.00 $45.00 $37.00
Section C - Delivery Fees
39 |Unscheduled or Late Delivery 1 [EA $400.00] $295.00] $250.00]  $500 - no bid| $500.00
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Environmental Environmental |Environmental| Environmental | Enviroserve
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Principal Place of Business (City and State):|  Norwell, MA _ [King of Prussia, PA| ™ """ | Davie, FL _|Fort Worth, TX
Line # Description QTY| UOM Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing Pricing
40 [Scheduled Delivery Weekend/After Hours 1 EA $400.00 $590.00 $250.00 $590 - no bid $350.00
Section D - Labor Charges
42 |On-Site Labor-Chemist 1 Per Hour $60.00 $75.00 $75.00 $75.00 $105.00
43 |On-Site Labor-Environmental Tech 1 Per Hour $50.00 $65.00 $75.00 $70.00 $92.00
Section E - Shipping Supplies
45 |55 Gallon Drum Metal Open Top Reconditioned (DOT) 1 EA $102.00 $74.00 $68.00 No Charge $150.00
46 |55 Gallon Drum MetalNew Open Top(DOT) 1 EA $138.00 $115.00 $133.00 No Charge $150.00
47 |55 Gallon Drum Poly Open Top(DOT) 1 EA $100.00 $74.00 $98.00 No Charge $153.00
48 |30 Gallon Drum Poly Open Top(DOT) 1 EA $108.00 $74.00 $90.00 No Charge $112.00
49 |15 Gallon Drum Poly Open Top(DOT) 1 EA $89.00 $57.00 $62.00 No Charge $174.00
50 |5 Gallon Drum Poly Open Top(DOT) 1 EA $24.00 $30.00 $25.00 No Charge $34.00
51 |Cubic Yard Box 1 EA $93.00 $85.00 $100.00 No Charge $227.00
52 |Cubic Yard Box Liner 1 EA $32.00 $15.00 $0.00 No Charge $14.00
53 |Pallet 1 EA $40.00 $34.00 $50.00 No Charge $16.00
Section F - Other Fees
55 |On Site Training/Recertification for City of Denton Employees | 1 |Per Person $50.00 No Charge $99.00 No Charge $595.00
$10,663.90 $13,934.50 $24,433.00 $22,587.00 $33,819.83
Evaluation
Clean Harbors Tradebe Triumvirate
Environmental Clean Earth Environmental | Environmental Enviroserve
Item # Standard Criteria Services, Inc. Environmental Solu Services Serv
1|Delivery/Project Schedule - 10% 6.67 6.00 6.67 4.67 6.00
2|Compliance with Specifications - 20% 8.00 13.33 10.67 12.00 9.33
3|Probable Performance - 30% 22.00 20.00 18.00 12.00 18.00
4|Price, Total Cost of Ownership - 40% 40.00 30.61 17.46 18.89 12.61
Total Score: 76.67 69.94 52.80 47.56 45.94




